
 

 

     City of 

Rifle 

 
 

 
 

CITY COUNCIL  
AGENDA 

 
Jay Miller, Mayor 
Alan Lambert, Mayor Pro Tem 
Richard Carter, Councilor 
Keith Lambert, Councilor 
Jonathan Rice, Councilor 
Jennifer Sanborn, Councilor 
Randy Winkler, Councilor 

 
 
 

 
City Hall 

City Council Chambers 
202 Railroad Avenue 

Rifle, CO  
 

Cablecast Live on 
 Comcast Channel 10 

              
 
The City of Rifle will make reasonable accommodations for access to City services, programs, and activities and will 
make special communication arrangements for persons with disabilities.  Please call (970) 665-6405 for assistance. 

              
REGULAR MEETING 
November 2, 2011 

 
WORKSHOP 6:00 P.M. 
CONFERENCE ROOM 

 
6:00 P.M.   Gravel Pit Watershed District Permit Inspection Report (Jim Neu and SGM) 

 
6:30 P.M. Budget Wrap-up 

 
REGULAR MEETING 7:00 P.M. 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS 
 

The City Council may take action on any of the following agenda items as presented or modified 
prior to or during the meeting, and items necessary or convenient to effectuate the agenda 
items. 
 
7:00 p.m. 1.  Regular Meeting Call to Order and Roll Call 

 
7:03 p.m. 2.  Consent Agenda – consider approving the following items: 

A. Minutes from the October 19, 2011 Regular Meeting 
B. Liquor License Renewal: Creekbend Coffee Inc. 
C. Text Amendment 2011-4 and Map Amendment 2011-1 Downtown 

Zoning Code and Zoning Map Revisions – Ordinance No. 11, 
Series of 2011 - second reading 

D. Amend Refuse Hauling Code – Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
- second reading 

E. Revise liquor application fees – Ordinance No. 14, Series of 2011 
- second reading 

F. Amend board appointment regulations– Ordinance No. 15, Series 
of 2011 - second reading 



 

 - 2 - 

G. Record Notice and Affidavit of Default Regarding Rifle Heights 
Subdivision 

H. Accounts Payable 
 

7:08 p.m. 3.  Citizen Comments and Live Call-In ((970) 665-6406) 
(For issues NOT on the Agenda.  Please limit comments to 3 minutes.) 
 

7:11 p.m. 4.  Action, if any, on Workshop Items (Mayor Miller) 
 

7:15 p.m. 5.  Public Hearing – Special Event Liquor Permit – BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge 
#2195 – Rifle Fire Protection District’s Holiday Event (Lisa Cain) 
 

7:25 p.m. 6.  Public Hearing – Special Event Liquor Permit – BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge 
#2195 – City of Rifle’s Holiday Event (Lisa Cain) 
 

7:35 p.m. 7.  Public Hearing - consider adopting 2009 International Building Codes – 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 - second reading (Matt Sturgeon) 
 

7:45 p.m. 8.  Public Hearing - 2012 Proposed Budget (Charles Kelty) 

8:15 p.m. 9.  Consider Amending Liquor Code Regarding Suspension of Liquor 
Licenses – Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 – first reading (Jim Neu) 
 

8:25 p.m. 10.  Consider Contract with Bureau of Reclamation for 200 Acre Feet of 
Ruedi Reservoir Water (Jim Neu) 
 

8:35 p.m. 11.  Administrative Reports 
A. City Manager Verbal Report 
B. Other Reports 

 
8:45 p.m. 12.  Comments from Mayor and Council 

 
 

The order and times of agenda items listed above are approximate and 
 intended as a guideline for the City Council.  

 Next Regular Meeting of Council: November 16, 2011 at 7:00 p.m. 

 



 

 
Rifle City Council Meeting, October 19, 2011 

 
- 1 - 

RIFLE CITY COUNCIL MEETING 
 

Wednesday, October 19, 2011 
 

REGULAR MEETING 
 

7:00 p.m. * Council Chambers 
 
 

A regular meeting of the Rifle City Council was called to order at 7:00 p.m. by Mayor Jay Miller. 
 
PRESENT ON ROLL CALL:  Councilors Rich Carter, Alan Lambert, Jen Sanborn, Randy Winkler, and Mayor 
Jay Miller. 
 
Councilor A. Lambert moved to excuse Councilors Keith Lambert and Jonathan Rice from tonight’s meeting; 
seconded by Councilor Sanborn. Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
OTHERS PRESENT:  John Hier, City Manager; Matt Sturgeon, Assistant City Manager / Director of Planning; 
Lisa Cain, City Clerk; Jim Neu, City Attorney; Jim Bell, Channel 10 Manager; Dick Deussen, Utilities Director; 
Aleks Briedis, Recreation Director; Daryl Meisner, Police Chief; Rick Barth, City Engineer; Nancy Bayne; 
Annick Pruett; Matt Robbins; and Lynne Miller. 
 
CONSENT AGENDA - APPROVE THE FOLLOWING ITEMS:   
A. Minutes from the October 5, 2011 Regular Meeting 
B. Deed of Exclusive Access and Utility Easement with Richard W. Rhoades, Karen S. Rhoades, Gene J. Maes, 

and Brenda S. Maes 
C. Liquor License Renewal: Shanghai Garden 
D. August Financial Statements 
E. Accounts Payable 
 
Councilor A. Lambert moved to approve Consent Agenda Items A, B, C, D, and E; seconded by Councilor 
Sanborn. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
CITIZEN COMMENTS AND LIVE CALL-IN  
There were no citizen comments or live call-ins. 
 
PUBLIC HEARING – SPECIAL EVENT LIQUOR PERMIT – BPOE LODGE RIFLE LODGE 
#2195/GRAND RIVER HOSPITAL DISTRICT’S HOLIDAY EVENT 
Mayor Miller opened the public hearing and swore in Nancy Bayne and Annick Pruett, representing BPOE Lodge 
Rifle Lodge #2195 and Grand River Hospital District, respectively. Ms. Bayne and Ms. Pruett presented the 
Lodge’s application for a special event permit to provide liquor service at the District’s Holiday Event on 
December 3, 2011, at the Hospital’s premises. City Clerk Lisa Cain stated that the hearing was properly noticed, 
the application is complete, and the fees have been paid. 
 
Councilor Winkler moved to approve the Special Event Liquor Permit for BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 on 
December 3, 2011, at Grand River Hospital District; seconded by Councilor Carter. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 



 

 
Rifle City Council Meeting, October 19, 2011 

 
- 2 - 

 
RECEIVE PRESENTATION OF COLORADO LOTTERY STARBURST AWARD  
Matt Robbins, Community Relations Specialist with the Colorado Lottery, presented to Mayor Miller and 
Recreation Director Aleks Briedis the Colorado Lottery Starburst Award recognizing excellence in use of lottery 
funds in the construction of Centennial Park. 
 
CONSIDER ADOPTING TEXT AMENDMENT 2011-4 AND MAP AMENDMENT 2011-1 DOWNTOWN 
ZONING CODE AND ZONING MAP REVISIONS - ORDINANCE NO. 11, SERIES OF 2011 – SECOND 
READING 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, ADOPTING A NEW ARTICLE 
XVIII OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE GOVERNING THE CENTRAL BUSINESS ZONE 
DISTRICT AND AMENDING VARIOUS SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 16 OF THE RIFLE 
MUNICIPAL CODE TO COINCIDE WITH THE NEW ARTICLE XVIII 

 
Assistant City Manager / Director of Planning Matt Sturgeon reminded Council that in 2008 the City adopted the 
Downtown Master Plan as the official plan for the Downtown Planning Area of Rifle. The Downtown Master 
Plan recognized that the Downtown should be a commercial, residential, entertainment and cultural focal point of 
the community and should represent the best that Rifle has to offer in terms of housing, shopping, entertainment, 
services, recreation, and civic amenities, all in a vibrant, cohesive environment. To implement the goals of the 
Downtown Master Plan, staff has worked with consultants and solicited the opinion of business owners and 
members of the community to adopt a new Article XVIII of Chapter 16 to the Rifle Municipal Code, which 
Article establishes a comprehensive zoning regime for a re-envisioned Central Business District (“CBD”) in the 
City. The new Article XVIII that would be enacted by proposed Ordinance No. 11, Series of 2011, establishes 
several sub-districts within the CBD but uses unifying elements such as streetscaping, landscaping, and signage 
throughout the CBD with well thought-out building scale, intensity, design, and exterior materials used to help 
provide smooth and appropriate transitions between projects and sub-districts. The Rifle Planning Commission 
unanimously recommended the adoption of the new Article XVIII. Ordinance No. 11 would also amend 
numerous sections of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code to reflect the new stand-alone Article related to the 
CBD. Council held the required public hearing at its last meeting on first reading.  
 
Following first reading, a citizen observed that the ordinance encourages on-site water collection for irrigation 
(e.g., rain barrels). This practice is currently prohibited by state regulations because of its interference with water 
rights. Mr. Neu recommended that Council approve the ordinance with these references to on-site water collection 
removed. 
 
Councilor Winkler moved to approve Ordinance No. 11, Series of 2011, on second reading as amended and to 
order it to be published in full as required by Charter; seconded by Councilor Sanborn. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
CONSIDER APPOINTING A MEMBER TO PLANNING AND ZONING COMMISSION 
Mr. Sturgeon reported that staff received applications for an alternate seat on the Planning and Zoning 
Commission seat from Marc Caldwell and Barbara Clifton. Council interviewed Mr. Caldwell and Ms. Clifton in 
a workshop session on October 11. 
 
Councilors cast ballots, which Ms. Cain tallied. Ms. Clifton received a majority of the votes. 
 



 

 
Rifle City Council Meeting, October 19, 2011 

 
- 3 - 

Councilor A. Lambert moved to appoint Barbara Clifton to serve on the Planning and Zoning Commission as an 
alternate member; seconded by Councilor Sanborn. Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, 
Miller 
 
CONSIDER AMENDING REFUSE HAULING CODE - ORDINANCE NO. 13, SERIES OF 2011 – 
SECOND READING 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING CHAPTER 6, 
ARTICLE VII OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE AND APPENDIX A TO IMPLEMENT 
THE CITY’S CONTRACTED SOLID WASTE REMOVAL AND RECYCLABLES 
COLLECTION PROCEDURES 

 
Mr. Neu and Mr. Hier said the City recently entered into a Solid Waste Removal and Recyclables Collection 
Agreement with Mountain Roll-Offs Inc. (“MRI”) whereby MRI agreed to provide curbside recycling and waste 
removal services within the City as a contractor of the City. As provided by statute, multi-family residences of 
eight or more units and industrial or commercial uses retain the option of contracting with a licensed refuse hauler 
to provide private waste removal services. The City will continue to bill its customers, but MRI will provide pick-
up and disposal services under the Agreement with the City. As part of the Agreement, MRI will also collect 
recyclables, the cost of which service will be included in each customer’s waste removal bill. The new rates, 
which have decreased, can be seen in Section 11 of proposed Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011. Contracting the 
City’s refuse hauling services and the inclusion of recycling services require some additional revisions to Chapter 
6, Article VII of the Rifle Municipal Code, which regulates refuse hauling in the City, as shown in the Ordinance. 
 
Councilor A. Lambert moved to approve Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011, on second reading as presented and to 
order it to be published in full as required by Charter; seconded by Councilor Sanborn. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
CONSIDER REVISING LIQUOR APPLICATION FEES - ORDINANCE NO. 14, SERIES OF 2011 – 
SECOND READING 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING THE LIQUOR 
LICENSE FEES AT APPENDIX A TO THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE TO INCLUDE A FEE 
FOR SPECIAL EVENT PERMITS, ELIMINATE OUTDATED FEES, AND INCLUDE 
CERTAIN APPLICATION FEES 
 

Mr. Neu reported that by passage of Senate Bill 11-1066, the Colorado state legislature signed into law 
amendments to C.R.S. §12-48-103, et seq. which allow local licensing authorities to approve or deny applications 
for special events permits involving the sale, by the drink only, of alcoholic beverages without the state signing 
off on the activity concurrently. As of August 10th, the City as local licensing authority is the sole entity to review 
and approve applications for these events. The new statutory provision allows a fee of $100.00 that the local 
licensing authority may charge for a special events permit to cover the costs of processing the application. 
Ordinance No. 14, Series of 2011 before the Council on second reading would amend Appendix A of the Rifle 
Municipal Code (“RMC”) to provide for this application fee under the liquor license application fees authorized 
by Section 6-5-150 of the RMC. Ms. Cain has reviewed the statutory application fees for other types of permits 
and proposes a few other minor amendments to the liquor license fee schedule accordingly. 
 
Councilor Sanborn moved to approve Ordinance No. 14, Series of 2011, on second reading as presented and to 
order it to be published in full as required by Charter; seconded by Councilor A. Lambert. Roll Call:  Yes – 
Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 



 

 
Rifle City Council Meeting, October 19, 2011 

 
- 4 - 

 
CONSIDER AMENDING BOARD APPOINTMENT REGULATIONS - ORDINANCE NO. 15, SERIES OF 
2011 – SECOND READING 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING SECTIONS 2-9-50 
AND 2-12-50 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE REGARDING ELECTION OF OFFICERS 
TO ADVISORY BOARDS 
 

Mr. Neu explained that by Ordinance No. 20, Series of 2008, the Council amended certain sections of RMC 
Chapter 2 to stagger the appointment dates for various City boards and commissions. Previously many of the 
terms started on January 1st of each year. The goal was to spread out the appointments over the course of the year 
for ease of administration. Visitor Improvement Fund Advisory Board appointments were moved to June of each 
year and Parks and Recreation Advisory Board appointments to February. However, Chapter 2 describes the 
election of officers for the boards occurring in January and November, respectively. Staff recommends moving 
the officer election dates to coincide with the appointment of new members. Proposed Ordinance No. 15, Series 
of 2011 would amend Sections 2-9-50 and 2-12-50 of the RMC accordingly. 
 
Councilor Carter moved to approve Ordinance No. 15, Series of 2011, on second reading as presented and to 
order it to be published in full as required by Charter; seconded by Councilor A. Lambert. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
CONSIDER AWARDING CONTRACT FOR PUMP INSTALLATION AT NORTHEAST BOOSTER 
STATION 
Utilities Director Dick Deussen requested that Council award a contract for installation of a water pump at the 
Northeast Booster Station to Rocky Mountain Electric Motors in an amount not to exceed $26,000. The City 
needs this additional pump to meet summer demands in the Northeast Zone and to serve as a standby unit when 
the other two pumps are in operation. 
 
Councilor Winkler moved to award a contract for installation of a water pump at the Northeast Booster Station to 
Rocky Mountain Electric Motors in an amount not to exceed $26,000; seconded by Councilor Sanborn. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
DISCUSS WOOD STOVE EXCHANGE PROGRAM 
Mr. Sturgeon informed Council that Garfield County is starting a Pilot Woodstove Exchange Program in 
connection with the settlement of an enforcement action taken by the Colorado Department of Public Health and 
Environment for violations of environmental laws and regulations.  
 
This program will help to start reducing fine particle pollution and promote energy efficiency in Garfield County 
by assisting low income homeowners with funds to remove outdated, high emitting woodstoves and fireplaces. 
Garfield County requests that local City Building Officials inspect the new installations and issue permits at no 
charge. The City of Rifle’s typical fee for such a permit and inspection is $50. 
 
Councilor Sanborn moved to waive City building permit and inspection fees to exchange woodstoves pursuant to 
the Garfield County Pilot Woodstove Exchange Program; seconded by Councilor A. Lambert. 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 



 

 
Rifle City Council Meeting, October 19, 2011 

 
- 5 - 

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS 
Mr. Hier reported to Council on the following issues: 2012 budget preparation; street construction; transition to 
solid waste collection by MRI; phase-out of recycling center; and Fall Festival. 
 
Ms. Cain noted that the Brenden Theatre 7 ribbon-cutting was planned for December 15, and the City holiday 
party for December 16. 
 
Mr. Sturgeon updated Council on Rifle Creek Plaza construction. 
 
Mr. Neu attended the Colorado Municipal League’s attorneys conference and was proud to report to other 
attendees about the good things happening in Rifle. 
 
Mr. Deussen said that 8th Street paving would occur next week. 
 
COMMENTS FROM MAYOR AND COUNCIL 
Councilor Sanborn reminded citizens to watch for new yellow and blue recycling bins to be delivered to them 
with an instruction packet from MRI. She thanked staff and Council for their hard work during budget season. 
 
Councilor A. Lambert noted that the road work at 26th Street and Railroad Avenue is being done by the Colorado 
Department of Transportation and is related to the reconstruction of the Kum & Go store at that intersection. He 
thanked Mayor Miller for his perseverance in presiding at meetings following surgery. 
 
Councilor Carter is the head coach for Rifle High School boys soccer, and he encouraged the community to come 
to tomorrow night’s game at the high school. A win would mean a playoff berth. 
 
Mayor Miller attended the 1st Annual Fall Festival and had a wonderful time. 
 
EXECUTIVE SESSION 
EXECUTIVE SESSION FOR A CONFERENCE WITH THE CITY ATTORNEY FOR THE PURPOSE OF 
RECEIVING LEGAL ADVICE ON SPECIFIC LEGAL QUESTIONS UNDER CRS 24-6-402(4)(B) 
 
Councilor Sanborn moved to adjourn to executive session to receive legal advice; seconded by Councilor 
A.Lambert (7:55 p.m.). 
 
Roll Call:  Yes – Carter, A. Lambert, Sanborn, Winkler, Miller 
 
Meeting adjourned at 8:22 p.m. 
 
 
                             
Lisa H. Cain           Jay D. Miller 
City Clerk            Mayor  



 

 

 

To:    Mayor and City Council; John Hier, City Manager 
 
From:   Lisa Cain, City Clerk 
 
Date:   Friday, October 28, 2011  
  
Subject:  Liquor License Renewal 
 
THIS BUSINESS HAS FILED ITS LIQUOR LICENSE RENEWAL APPLICATION: 
 
Business Name/Address Type of License 
Creekbend Coffee Inc. 
121 E 3rd St 
 

Beer and Wine License 

 
The following criteria have been met by this business: 

· The application is complete. 
· The fees have been paid. 

 
Based on the above information, I recommend approval of this renewal application. 
 



LIQUOR OR 3.2 BEER LICENSE
RENEWAL APPLICATION

NEVONEN OLINDA & NEVONEN JOHN
CREEKBEND COFFEE INC
PD BOX 1899
RIFLE CO 81650

This renewal reflects no changes from the tast ap
plication. Complete page 2 and file nowl

C Yes there are changes from the last application.
If applicant is a Corporation or Limited L. iahihty com
pany, use DR 8177 and send in with this renewal.
Any other changes of ownership require a transfer
of ownership. See your Local Licensing Authority
immediately.

Wholesaler, manufacturer, importer, and public transportation
system license renewals do not need Local Licensing Author
ity approval and must be returned directly to the Colorado De
partment of Revenue at least 30 days prior to the current li
cense expiration date.

This application for renewal must be returned to your CITY OR
COUNTY Licensing Authority at least 45 days prior to the expira
lion date of your current license. Failure to do so may result In
your license not being renewed, include both pages of this renewal
and payment.

SUB-TOTALADD $100.00 TO RENEW RETAIL WAREHOUSE STORAGE PERMIT221O-100(999)
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

DR 8400(11/09/06)
COLORADO DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
DENVER. cot.ORADO 80261

Ucense Number LicenseT pe
15-70520-0000 16O

Uabllitv Information
24 035 424810 P 120508

Business Location

121 E 3RD
RIFLE CO

Current Ucense Expires

DEC 04, 2011
DEPARTMENTAL USE ONLY

Total Amount Due

Total Paid Dato

OATH OF APPLICANT
I declare under penalty of ,perjury in the second degree that this application and all attachments are true, correct, and complete to thebest of my knowledge. /

Authoriz g ti a ‘j, Date Business Phone
/ v / ftc

litle ‘ Sales Tax Number

REPORT AND APPROVAL OF CITY OR COUNTY LICENSING AUThORITY
The foregoing application has been examined and the premises, business conducted and character of the applicant are satisfactory, and we
do hereby report that such license, if granted, will comply with the provisions of Title 12, Articles 46 and 47, CR5.
ThEREFORE THIS APPLICATION IS APPROVED.
Local Licensing Authority for Date

Signature jTltJe JAttest

--— zh TZEZTEJ *.:LZE*z
DR 8400(11/09/06) I ml InC nO ‘ 0 DCCC I IC’CMCC Mn chedc yabIe to: Corado Department of Revenue.The State may nvefl your
COLORADO DEPARIMENTOF REVENUE

‘at’ tfl Lfl “-Fl- “JI- cheduoaonetmaedront*rcfrar.sheft Thurr4cawntmaybeathtedas
RENEWAL APPLICATION catty the same day rsceiVe4lbytileStale. foonverted, yourttiedcwtl riotbe retumeDENvER, COLORADO 80261

yOur ctieck Is rejected da to ãisuffident or untIcced furs, the De,tmeiO of Rev.
ernie may Iieo me yrnen: amount dIrfy from your banking aunt eIectrcr.ilIyBusiness Name LICENSE NUMBER (Use for all reference) PERIOD

CREEKBEND COFFEE INC 15-70520-0000 12-12TYPE OF LICENSE ISSUED CASH FUND STATE FEE
BEER AND WINE LICENSE - CITY 85% OAPMALT AND VINOUS LIQUORS 2320-100(999) 1960-750(999) 2180-100(999)

$ 50.00 $ 25.00 $ 276.25

$ 351.25
$____

$____



DR 8401 (0797)
COLORADO DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
LIQUOR ENFORCEMENT DIVISION
81 PIERCE

ATTACHMENT TO LIQUOR OR
(303) 205-2300

3.2 BEER LICENSE RENEWAL APPLICATION
This page must be completed and attached to your signed renewal application form.

Failure to Include this page with the application may result in your license not being renewed.

Trade Pjame of Establishment State License Number
Creeir-ht,c1 (oRe J,tJ€- /5- 7c5Jcoooc

1. Operating Manager Home Address Date of Birth
)tI’NOk AIPvc,ler-)

- .
- -

2. Do you have legal possession of the premises for which this application lot license is made? Yes No
Are the premises owned or rented: 1?EJ 7E ‘2 If rented, expiration date of lease: /)E7c ‘2ot ‘, D

3. Has there bean any change in financial interest (new notes, loans, owners, etc.) since the last annual application? If yes, explain in Yes Nodetail and attach a listing of all liquor businesses in which these new lenders or owners, (other than licensed financial Institutions) are
materially interested.

4. Since the date of filing of the last annual application, has the applicant, or any of its agents, owners, managers, principals, or lenders Ves No
(other than licensed financial Institutions), been convicted ot a crime? It yes, attach a detailed explanation. U

5. Since the date of tiling of the last annual application, has the applicant, or any of its agents, owners, managers, principals, or lenders
(other than licensed financial institutions), been denied an alcoholic beverage license, had an alcoholic beverage license suspended or Yes No
revoked, or had interest in any entity that had an alcoholic beverage license denied, suspended or revoked? If yes, attach a detailed Uexplanation.

6. Ooes the applIcant, or any of its agents, owners, managers, principals, or lenders (other than licensed financial institutions), have a Yes Nodirect or indirect interest in any other Colorado liquor license (include loans to or from any licensee, or interest in a loan to any
licensee)? If yes, attach a detailed explanation.

7. Sole owners or husband-wIfe partnerships answer this question. Since the date of filing of the last annual license application:
Has ownership changed In whole or in part, from a sole owner to any other person, partnership, corporation, or limited liability Yes No
company other than the licensee listed on your state liquor license? If yes, this license must be transferred to the new owner and Umay not be renewed. Contact your Local Authority immediately. bY

8. Partnership applIcants must answer this question. Since the date of filing of the last annual license application: Yes No
(a) Are there, or have there been any general partners added to. or deleted from the partnership? If yes, this license must be U Utransferred to the new partnership and may not be renewed. Contact your Local Authority immediately.
(b) Are there, or have there been any limited partners with a 10% or more interest, added or deleted from the partnership? If yes, this F— Flhcense must be transferred to the new partnership and may not be renewed. Contact your Local Authority immedIately.

9. Corporate applicants must answer this question. Since the date of filing of the last annuai license application:
Yes No(a) Are there, or have there been any officers or directors added to. or deleted from the corporation? If yes, complete and attach

DR 8177 and submit to your Local Authority immediately.
(b) Are there, or have there been any stockholders with 10% or more of the issued stock, added to, or deleted from the corporation?

If yes, complete and attach DR 8177 and submit to your Local Authority immediately. U IXi(c) Date of filing last annual corporate report with the Colorado Secretary of State: 73 V r.. 2 0 ‘I

10. LImited Liability company appilcants must answer thIs question. Since the date of filing of the last annual license application: Yes No(a) Are there, or have there been any managing members added to. or deleted from the company? If yes, complete and attach
DR 8177 and submit to your Local Authority immediately.

(b) Are there, or have there been any members with 10% or more membership interest, added to, or deleted from the company?
it yes, complete and attach DR 8177 and submit to your Local Authority immediately. U U(c) Date of tiling last annual LLCO report with the Colorado Secretary of State:

11. Bed and Breakfast applicants must answer this question and certify compliance with 12-47-118.5 CR8., to the state licensing
authority by initialing the following listed questions:

That it has no more than 20 sleeping rooms, and
That it provides at least I meal per day at no charge other than for overnight lodging. and
That it does not sell alcoholic beverages by the drink or in sealed containers, and
That it shall not serve alcoholic beverages for more than 4 hours In any one day, as follows:

MONDAY HOURS TUESDAY HOURS WEDNESDAY HOURS THURSDAY HOURS FRIDAY HOURS SATURDAY HOURS SUNDAY HOURS
From: 7j4 m. From: 7 m. From: 7.4 m. From: fr/ A m. From: 74 m. From: 74 m. From: IA m.

To: To: (m. To: 3em. To: 3.) m. To: 9pm. To: 9,; m. To: .,,R,Om.



 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 11 

SERIES OF 2011 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, ADOPTING A 
NEW ARTICLE XVIII OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE GOVERNING 
THE CENTRAL BUSINESS ZONE DISTRICT AND AMENDING VARIOUS 
SECTIONS OF CHAPTER 16 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE TO 
COINCIDE WITH THE NEW ARTICLE XVIII. 

 
 

This Ordinance is too large to include in the November 2nd Council packet.  Please use 
the following link to view this Ordinance: 

 
http://co-rifle.civicplus.com/Archive.aspx?ADID=964 

http://co-rifle.civicplus.com/Archive.aspx?ADID=964


 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 13 

SERIES OF 2011 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING 
CHAPTER 6, ARTICLE VII OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE AND 
APPENDIX A TO IMPLEMENT THE CITY’S CONTRACTED SOLID 
WASTE REMOVAL AND RECYCLABLES COLLECTION PROCEDURES. 

 
 WHEREAS, Chapter 6, Article VII of the Rifle Municipal Code establishes the City of 
Rifle’s regulations for refuse hauling; and 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 30-15-401, C.R.S., the City is authorized to provide 
residential refuse services for the collection and transportation of ashes, trash, rubbish, garbage, 
or any other discarded materials and to impose fees for such services, provided, however, that 
multi-family residences of eight or more units, and industrial or commercial uses cannot be 
compelled to utilize the City’s services; and 

 WHEREAS, the City recently entered into a Solid Waste Removal and Recyclables 
Collection Agreement with a contractor to provide waste removal services to Rifle residents 
which includes recycling services; and 

WHEREAS, the Rifle City Council finds and determines that the best interests of the 
citizens of Rifle will be served by adopting the following amendments to Chapter 6, Article VII 
of the Rifle Municipal Code accordingly. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF RIFLE, COLORADO, THAT: 
 

Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as if set forth in full. 
 
 Section 2. Section 6-7-10 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended by the 
addition of the following definitions, to be inserted in alphabetical order. 
 
 6-7-10.  Definitions. 
 
 Licensed refuse hauler means a person or entity which has obtained current authority 

from the Colorado Public Utilities Commission to collect, transport or remove refuse, 
garbage, rubbish, recyclables, or toxic refuse within the City and registered such 
authority with the City Manager. 

 
 Recyclables means a combination of recyclable materials including newspapers, 

magazines, office paper, junk mail, telephone books, cardboard, paperboard, aluminum, 
tin, glass, plastic, and other similar products comingled in a common container or in 
separate containers for collection. 

 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
Page 2 of 6 
 

 

 
Section 3. Section 6-7-20 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text:  
 

 6-7-20.  Registration and licensing of refuse haulers. 

(a) Only the following may collect, transport or remove refuse, garbage, rubbish, 
recyclables, or toxic refuse from any location within the City: 

(1) An individual removing refuse or recyclables from his or her own property, using 
his or her own equipment. 

(2) The City, utilizing the collection system hereinafter established. 

(3) Licensed refuse haulers.  

(b) No other person shall collect, transport or remove refuse, garbage, rubbish, 
recyclables, or toxic refuse from or over any of the streets or alleys of the City.   

 
 Section 4. Section 6-7-30 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows, with deletions shown in strike through text. 
 
 6-7-30.  Collection system established. 

A system for the collection and disposal of refuse is established for the benefit of all 
persons residing within the City limits.  This system shall serve all commercial, industrial and 
residential establishments within the City, except for customers of licensed refuse haulers.  
Refuse shall be collected at least once per week by the City or its refuse hauler contractor 
from all locations within the City limits, and more often when deemed necessary or appropriate 
by the City Manager.   
 
 Section 5. Section 6-7-40(b) of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and deletions in strike through 
text. 
 

6-7-40.  Initiation and termination of service. 
 
* * * 
 (b) Initiation of service shall be effective upon the customer's receipt of a City-

provided container provided by the City or the City’s refuse hauler contractor.  Containers 
will not be delivered until issuance of a certificate of occupancy.  Upon initiation, the customer 
shall be billed for the portion of the billing cycle in which trash collection services were 
provided.   

 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
Page 3 of 6 
 

 

Section 6. Section 6-7-60(a) of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text. 

 
6-7-60.  Rates, charges and requirements. 
 
(a) Rates and charges for the City refuse system shall be as set forth in Appendix A to 

this Code.  Refuse collection rates and charges shall include the cost of recyclables collection 
as described in Section 6-7-190. 

Section 7. Section 6-7-110(c) of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 
as follows, with deletions shown in strike through text. 

 
6-7-110. Placement of containers. 

 
 * * * 
 (c) Containers and all other authorized bags, cans, bundles or other items may be 
placed in other locations accessible to City sanitation trucks if approved by the City Manager or 
the City’s refuse hauler contractor.   
 

Section 8. Section 6-7-120 (a), (b) and (c) of the Rifle Municipal Code are hereby 
amended to read as follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and deletions 
shown in strike through text. 
 

6-7-120. Requirements for City trash and recyclables containers. 
 

(a) Unless specifically authorized by the City Manager, the City or its refuse hauler 
contractor shall collect trash and recyclables only from those trash containers meeting City 
specifications compatible with City collection equipment. 

 
(b) The City or its refuse hauler contractor will initially provide one (1) sixty-four-

gallon, ninety-six-gallon or three-hundred-gallon container for trash collection and two 
appropriately sized containers for recyclables to each residential or commercial customer at 
the time the dwelling unit is first served.  Thereafter, the customer shall be responsible to 
maintain it in good condition.  However, the City may perform minor repairs to the containers as 
appropriate in the City's discretion.  Replacement of the container, if required due to user neglect 
or loss of the container for any reason, shall be at the customer's expense.  All containers are 
owned by the City or its refuse hauler contractor and shall not be removed from the property 
served. 

(c) Upon termination of service, any City-supplied commercial all containers must be 
in good condition or the customer will be charged for the cost of repair or replacement. 

*** 
Section 9. Section 6-7-130(b) of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
Page 4 of 6 
 

 

as follows, with deletions shown in strike through text. 
 
6-7-130. Special requirements for City system. 
 
* * * 
(b) Except as permitted through a duly noticed and implemented special service, 

special pickup or spring cleanup, the following materials will not be accepted for collection:  tree 
limbs or branches; material and debris produced by building construction, remodeling or 
demolition; toxic refuse; dead animal carcasses; bulk liquids; automobile and truck parts, bodies 
or chassis; abandoned appliances or furniture; any material which exceeds the capacity of the 
City's trash removal equipment; or any material which may constitute a danger or hazard, or 
cause injury to any employees or equipment of the City or its refuse hauler contractor.  of 
the City's employees or the City's trash removal equipment.   
 

Section 10. A new Section 6-7-190 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby adopted to 
read as following. 

 
6-7-190. Recyclables. 
 

 (a) As part of its refuse collection services, the City or its contractor agrees to provide 
recycling services to its refuse collection customers.  
 

(b) All recyclables shall be drained of liquid before being deposited for collection. 
 

(b) Recycling containers for those persons subject to the City's recycling services 
shall be provided by the City or its contractor as described in Section 6-7-120.  Such containers 
shall be used only for the collection of materials deemed as recyclable through a recycling 
system by the City's designated recycling facility. 

 
(c)  No person shall place, leave, deposit or dispose of any recyclables on any street, 

alley, or other public place, or on any private property, unless the recyclables are wholly 
contained within a single-stream recycling container. Any accumulation of recyclables in 
violation of this Article is declared to be a nuisance and is prohibited. 

 
Section 11. Appendix A of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to include the 

following rates and fees for refuse collection services, including recyclables, at Page Appx-3, 
with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and deletions shown in strike through text. 

 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
Page 5 of 6 
 

 

6-7-60 Refuse collection rates and charges  

 Single-family residential, multi-family 1 64-gallon container  $13.76 
12.50/month 

 Single-family residential, multi-family 2 64-gallon containers $25.46 
21.89/month 

 Single-family residential, multi-family 1 96-gallon container $17.24 
14.79/month 

 Single-family residential, multi-family 2 96-gallon containers $31.89 
26.18/month 

 Single-family residential, multi-family 1 96-gallon container  
      1 64-gallon container 

$28.94 
24.29/month 

 Commercial     1 64-gallon container $13.38 
13.14/month 

 Commercial     1 96-gallon container $16.86 
16.24/month 

 Commercial     2 96-gallon containers $33.72 
32.48/month 

 Commercial/multi-family   1 300-gallon container $41.95 
39.39/month 

 Commercial/multi-family, extra pickup, 
same location, same day   1 300-gallon container 

$26.63/month 

 Commercial/multi-family, extra pickup,  
same location, each extra day  1 300-gallon container 

$43.82/month 

 Commercial/multi-family special pickup 1 300-gallon container $30.15/pick-up 

 Special services for multi-family residential units with 300-gallon container $0.39/unit/month 
added to 300-gallon 

container  
account bill 

 Senior citizens/disabled persons discount 1 64- gallon or 1 96-gallon 
      residential container  

80% of  
applicable rate 

 
 

INTRODUCED on October 5, 2011, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered 
published by title as required by the Charter. 

 
INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the City of Rifle, 

Colorado, held on October 19, 2011 and November 2, 2011, passed without amendment, 
approved, and ordered published in full as required by the Charter. 
 

Dated this ___ day of __________________, 2011. 
 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
 
 

BY  ___________________________________ 
 Mayor 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 13, Series of 2011 
Page 6 of 6 
 

 

ATTEST:  
 
 
_______________________________ 
City Clerk 



 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 14 

SERIES OF 2011 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING THE 
LIQUOR LICENSE FEES AT APPENDIX A TO THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL 
CODE TO INCLUDE A FEE FOR SPECIAL EVENT PERMITS, ELIMINATE 
OUTDATED FEES, AND INCLUDE CERTAIN APPLICATION FEES.  

 
 WHEREAS, by passage of Senate Bill 11-1066, the Colorado state legislature signed into 
law amendments to C.R.S. §12-48-103, et seq. which allow local licensing authorizes the sole 
authority to approve or deny applications for special events permits involving the sale, by the 
drink only, of alcoholic beverages; and 

 WHEREAS, pursuant to the revised C.R.S. §12-48-107, the fee that may be assessed by 
the local licensing authority for a special event permit is capped at $100.00, and the City of Rifle 
wishes to memorialize such fee at Appendix A to the Rifle Municipal Code; and 

 WHEREAS, staff also recommends eliminating outdated liquor license application fees 
still appearing in Appendix A and adding application fees for certain types of permits as 
provided by state statute; and 

 WHEREAS, the Rifle City Council finds and determines the best interests of the citizens 
of Rifle will be served by eliminating the outdated fees from the Appendix, adding certain 
application fees, and implementing the special event permit fee with the caveat that the actual 
costs of providing notice of the public hearing will be the additional responsibility of the 
applicant. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF RIFLE, COLORADO, THAT: 
 

Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as if set forth in full. 
 
 Section 2. Page Appx-3 of Appendix A to the Rifle Municipal Code is amended to 
read as follows, with deletions shown in strike through text and additions in bold, double-
underlined text.  Fees not subject to amendment are not included on the table. 

 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 14, Series of 2011 
Page 2 of 2 
 

 

6-5-150 Liquor license fees    

 New license application: 09/15/08 — 07/01/09 $750.00 

 New license application: 07/02/09 — 07/01/10  $875.00 

 New license application: after 07/02/10 $1,000.00 

 New manager registration $75.00 $50.00 

 Special event liquor or 3.2% beer permit $100.00  plus the actual costs of 
providing notice of public hearing 

 LLC/Corporate report of changes (per person) $100.00 
 Art gallery permit $100.00 plus the actual costs of 

providing notice of public hearing 

 
 
INTRODUCED on October 5, 2011, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered 

published by title as required by the Charter. 
 
INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the City of Rifle, 

Colorado, held on October 19, 2011 and November 2, 2011, passed without amendment, 
approved, and ordered published in full as required by the Charter. 
 

Dated this ___ day of __________________, 2011. 
 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
 
 

BY  ___________________________________ 
 Mayor 

 
 
 
 
ATTEST:  
 
 
_______________________________ 
City Clerk 
 



 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 15 

SERIES OF 2011 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING 
SECTIONS 2-9-50 AND 2-12-50 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE 
REGARDING ELECTION OF OFFICERS TO ADVISORY BOARDS.  

 
WHEREAS, Chapter 2, Article IX of the Rifle Municipal Code (“RMC”) creates the City 

of Rifle Parks and Recreation Advisory Board and governs the conduct of the board, including 
the appointment of members and officers to serve on the board; and 

 
Chapter 2, Article XII of the RMC creates the City of Rifle Visitor Improvements Fund 

Advisory Board and governs the conduct of the board, including the appointment of members 
and officers to serve on the board; and 

 
WHEREAS, by Ordinance No. 20, Series of 2008, the City specified at Sections 2-9-30 

and 2-12-30 of the RMC that terms of office for the Parks and Recreation Advisory Board and 
the Visitor Improvements Fund Advisory Board shall commence on February 1st and June 1st of 
each year, respectively, but RMC Sections 2-9-50 and 2-12-50 provide that the advisory boards 
shall organize by electing officers on the first day of November and January of each year, 
respectively; and 

 
WHEREAS, staff recommends amending RMC Sections 2-9-50 and 2-12-50 to provide 

for election of Parks and Recreation Advisory Board and Visitor Improvements Fund Advisory 
Board officers at the first meeting of each board following the appointment of any new members; 
and 

 
WHEREAS, the Rifle City Council finds and determines that RMC Sections 2-9-50 and 

2-12-50 should be amended accordingly. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 

OF RIFLE, COLORADO, THAT: 
 

Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as if set forth in full. 
 
Section 2. The first sentence of Section 2-9-50 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby 

amended to read as follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and deletions 
in strike through text. 

 
2-9-50.  Meetings and officers. 
 
At the first Board meeting following the commencement of new terms on February 1st of 

each year, As soon as practicable following the first day of January every year, the Parks and 
Recreation Advisory Board shall organize by electing three (3) of its members to serve as Chair, 
Vice-Chair and Secretary, respectively, to serve at the pleasure of the Parks and Recreation 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 15, Series of 2011 
Page 2 of 2 

 

Advisory Board. 
  
 Section 3. The first sentence of Section 2-12-50 of the Rifle Municipal Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and 
deletions in strike through text. 
  
 2-12-50. Meetings and officers. 
 

At the first Board meeting following the commencement of new terms on June 1st of each 
year, As soon as practicable following the first day of January every year, the Visitor Improvements Fund 
Advisory Board shall organize by electing three (3) of its members to serve as Chair, Vice-Chair and 
Secretary, respectively, to serve at the pleasure of the Visitor Improvements Fund Advisory Board. 

 
INTRODUCED on October 5, 2011, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered 

published by title as required by the Charter. 
 
INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the City of Rifle, 

Colorado, held on October 19, 2011 and November 2, 2011, passed without amendment, 
approved, and ordered published in full as required by the Charter. 
 

Dated this ___ day of __________________, 2011. 
 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
 
 

BY  ___________________________________ 
 Mayor 

 
 
 
 
ATTEST:  
 
 
_______________________________ 
City Clerk 
 



NOTICE AND AFFIDAVIT OF DEFAULT
REGARDING RIFLE HEIGHTS SUBDIVISION

STATE OF COLORADO )
) ss.

COUNTY OF GARFIELD )

I, John Hier, being first duly sworn, state and allege as follows:

1. I am the City Manager of the City of Rifle, Colorado (the “City”).

2. Rifle Heights Land Company, a Colorado limited liability company whose address is
P.O. Box 1301, Rifle, CO 81650 (“RHLC”), is the owner of the Rifle Heights Subdivision in the City of
Rifle, Colorado (“Rifle Heights” or the “Property”). RHLC executed that certain Site Specific
Development Plan and Subdivision Improvements Agreement with the City of Rifle regarding the
development of Phase 1 of the Property dated January 15, 2008, which Agreement is recorded at the
Office of the Garfield County Clerk and Recorder at Reception No. 743334 (hereinafter the “Phase 1
SL&”).

3. Paragraph 4 of the Phase 1 SIA required RHLC to remit to the City $159,101.70 for the
construction of a portion of Whiteriver Avenue fronting the Property to City standards (the “Whiteriver
Avenue Costs”) within eighteen (18) months of the recording of the Phase 1 Final Plat, i.e., no later than
August 21, 2009. After RHLC failed to pay the Whiteriver Avenue Costs by this deadline, the City
granted two extensions in the form of the First Amendment to Site Specific Development Plan and
Subdivision Improvements Agreement for Rifle Heights Subdivision recorded August 13, 2009, as
Reception No. 773240 (the “First Amendment”) and the Second Amendment to Site Specific
Development Plan and Subdivision Improvements Agreement for Rifle Heights Subdivision recorded
September 13, 2010 as Reception No. 791326 (the “Second Amendment”).

4. The Second Amendment included the following revision to the Phase 1 SIA concerning
the Whiteriver Avenue Costs:

The last sentence of Paragraph 4 of the SIA shall be amended to read: “Additionally, Developer
shall remit to the City $159,101.70, plus four percent (4%) interest commencing September 1,
2009 until paid, for the construction of a portion of Whiteriver Avenue fronting Rifle Heights
Subdivision to City standards, which amount shall be paid no later than Au2ust 21, 2011, and
prior to the recording of the second Final Plat for the Rifle Heights Subdivision.”

5. The August 21, 2011 extended deadline to remit the Whiteriver Avenue Costs to the City
as provided in the Phase 1 SIA and Second Amendment has passed and the City has not received the
Whiteriver Avenue Costs.

6. RHLC IS HEREBY DECLARED IN BREACH OF THE PHASE 1 SIA AS
AMENDED.

7. Therefore, with the recording of this Affidavit with the Garfield County Clerk and
Recorder’s Office, the City hereby exercises the following remedies pursuant to the Phase 1 SIA:

A) Until the Whiteriver Avenue Costs are paid in full, including all costs incurred by the
City related to collection, and this Affidavit released, no further lots or parcels owned by RHLC
within Phase 1 of the Property shall be conveyed to a third party purchaser without the release of



this Affidavit as to that lot. Upon information and belief, this lot sale restriction applies to Lots 1-
12, 14-23, 25-37, 39, 41-43, 86 and 93. Similarly, no building permit or certificate of occupancy
shall be issued for a lot or parcel owned by RHLC within Phase 1 of the Property without the
release of this Affidavit as to that lot. The release shall be in the form of an affidavit signed by
the City Manager or his designee and approved by the City Council stating that the default has
been satisfied as to that lot. This Affidavit shall in no way affect the sale or development of lots
in Phase 1 of the Property not owned by RHLC at the time of recording of this Affidavit.

B) No further development of future phases of the Property shall be considered by the City
until the Whiteriver Avenue Costs default has been cured, as evidenced by the recording of an
affidavit approved by the City Council and signed by the City Manager.

C) Nothing herein purports to convey any approvals for the creation of individual lots in
future phases of development on the Property, which creation requires a final plat and a
subdivision improvements agreement approved and signed by the City and recorded with the
Garfield County Clerk and Recorder.

D) Nothing contained herein shall limit or restrict the City from pursuing any and all
remedies available to it against RHLC.

AND FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO

7 -

-3ohn Hier, City Manager

STATE OF COLORADO
L

) ss.
COUNTY OF GARFIELD )

Acknowledged, subscribed and sworn to before me this.27 day of October, 2011, by John Hier,
City Manager, City of Rifle, Colorado.

WITNESS my hand and officiaj’seaV /7

My Commission expires 1/’ L//(J/ £/

N,(arliZ

KRISTY I CHRISTENSEN
Notary Public

State of Colorado

—-—.-.——.--——



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     1

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Report Criteria:

Summary report.

Invoices with totals above $0 included.

Paid and unpaid invoices included.

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

1003

Action Shop Services, Inc

SI62926 MECHANICAL SEAL KIT 10/06/2011 1,147.70 .00

          Total 1003: 1,147.70 .00

1009

B & B Plumbing, Inc

34708 EXTENDED DRAIN 09/07/2011 81.25- .00

34709 CLEARED OUT ICE MAKER LIN 09/07/2011 47.50- .00

34709. REPAIR DRAIN 09/07/2011 47.50 .00

          Total 1009: 81.25- .00

1018

Valley Lumber

59747 TOTE RBBRMD KEEPERS 10/06/2011 8.99 .00

59797 3 PK ROLLER COVER 10/07/2011 8.49 .00

59813 MUSH TOGGLE BOLT 10/07/2011 5.83 .00

59907 O-RIGINALS ANGLER BROOM 10/10/2011 27.96 .00

60040 CONTRACTOR WHLBRW 10/12/2011 69.99 .00

60047 BLUE STYROFOAM 10/12/2011 16.00 .00

60314 NIPPLE SCH80 10/19/2011 21.05 .00

60316 3/8 X8 16 SMART LAP TEXT 10/19/2011 50.97 .00

60346 CONSTRUCTION FIR 10/20/2011 68.38 .00

60374 12 SPEED SQUARE 10/20/2011 21.99 .00

          Total 1018: 299.65 .00

1022

Central Distributing Co

886758 Supplies 10/05/2011 55.15 .00

887029 Supplies 10/07/2011 118.36 .00

887091 Supplies 10/10/2011 69.92 .00

887311 Supplies 10/12/2011 88.41 .00

887929 Supplies 10/19/2011 128.41 .00

887933 Supplies 10/19/2011 297.42 .00

          Total 1022: 757.67 .00

1055

Columbine Ford, Inc

108748 HANDLE 10/12/2011 29.71 .00

108919 MOTOR ASY 10/18/2011 72.29 .00

          Total 1055: 102.00 .00

1059

Consolidated Electrical Distr

4983-520249 6 SYL CF26DT/E/IN/835 10/07/2011 45.00 .00

4983-520259 TWIN FLRLMP 10/07/2011 31.76 .00

4983-520357 SYL M175/U 10/11/2011 18.33 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     2

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 1059: 95.09 .00

1074

Garfield County Clerk

101811 RECORDING FEE/ planning 10/18/2011 .00 .00

101811. RECORDING FEE/ planning 10/18/2011 89.00 89.00 10/20/2011

          Total 1074: 89.00 89.00

1075

Garfield County Court Clerk

101811 RECORDING FEES 10/18/2011 .00 .00

          Total 1075: .00 .00

1087

Grainger

9652305385 SOLENOID VALVE GENERAL 2  10/04/2011 238.50 .00

9654492512 MICROSWITCH 10/06/2011 164.75 .00

9658198875 SOLENOID VALVE NC ALUMINU 10/11/2011 137.49 .00

          Total 1087: 540.74 .00

1094

Hy-way Feed & Ranch Supply

513020 BURLAP 10/12/2011 4.50 .00

          Total 1094: 4.50 .00

1097

Johnson Construction Inc

100811 RIFLE CREED PLAZA THEATER  10/08/2011 72,208.35 .00

102111 CONSTRUCTION RIFLE CREEK  10/21/2011 59,858.50 .00

          Total 1097: 132,066.85 .00

1105

Meadow Gold Dairies

50207671 DAIRY  PRODUCTS/SENIOR CT 10/13/2011 94.28 .00

50207738 DAIRY  PRODUCTS/SENIOR CT 10/20/2011 88.48 .00

          Total 1105: 182.76 .00

1106

Micro Plastics Inc

88447 TROPHY 10/14/2011 38.30 .00

88471 NAME PLATE 10/17/2011 44.00 .00

          Total 1106: 82.30 .00

1108

Mountain Clear Bottled Water

6884 093011 BOTTLED  WATER 09/30/2011 218.35 .00

          Total 1108: 218.35 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     3

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

1110

Napa Auto Parts

192510 WIPER BLADE 09/30/2011 7.69 .00

193114 AUXILIARY FOG LAMP 10/04/2011 21.29 .00

193502 SPARK PLUG 10/05/2011 4.66 .00

193825 LOG BOOK 10/07/2011 48.25 .00

194002 LG BOOK 10/08/2011 43.30 .00

194301 SMARTGLOW MIN FUSES 10/10/2011 3.29 .00

194318 OIL CAP 10/10/2011 5.49 .00

194800 HOSE 10/12/2011 115.36 .00

194853 RAD HOSE 10/12/2011 72.27 .00

195134 GREASE 10/14/2011 94.40 .00

195185 AIR FIL 10/14/2011 18.77 .00

195578 OUTL BX 10/17/2011 49.38 .00

195910 LOG BOOK 10/18/2011 43.30- .00

195948 DRIVEBELT IDLER PULLEY 10/19/2011 22.97 .00

196277 LITERAGS 10/20/2011 72.27 .00

          Total 1110: 536.09 .00

1111

Neve's Uniforms, Inc

NE9612 UNIFORM /PD 10/17/2011 220.84 .00

          Total 1111: 220.84 .00

1118

Parts House

5613-13187 TAILGATE HANDLE 09/26/2011 32.83 .00

5613-13528 WINTER BLADE 10/07/2011 221.20 .00

5613-13542 ADV GEN BATTERY 10/07/2011 75.44 .00

5613-13553 UNIVERSAL SWITCH 10/07/2011 9.57 .00

5613-13637 STANDARD U-JOINT 10/11/2011 192.59 .00

5613-13681 SUPER GLUE GEL 10/12/2011 9.17 .00

5613-13704 CQ/DELPHI ELECTRIC PUMPS 10/13/2011 139.29 .00

5613-13854 CQ/GATES BELT TENSIONERS 10/19/2011 65.47 .00

5613-13950 BRAKE CLEANER 10/21/2011 44.28 .00

          Total 1118: 789.84 .00

1120

Xcel Energy Inc

0319303382 300 W 5TH ST UNIT PUMP 10/03/2011 170.41 170.41 10/14/2011

0319899466 124 W 2ND ST APT B 10/06/2011 38.90 38.90 10/14/2011

0391490175 200 RAILROAD AVE 10/04/2011 418.77 418.77 10/14/2011

0391881504 236 W 4TH ST 10/06/2011 25.80 25.80 10/14/2011

0391905796 300 W 5TH ST UNIT STAGE 10/06/2011 79.68 79.68 10/14/2011

298874282 2515 W CENTENNIAL PKWY-UN 10/03/2011 5,651.27 5,651.27 10/14/2011

299812692 STREET LIGHTS 10/11/2011 12,047.95 12,047.95 10/21/2011

391129761 CLOCK 10/03/2011 6.03 6.03 10/14/2011

391129810 TRAFFIC LIGHTS 10/03/2011 78.10 78.10 10/14/2011

391130269 SPRINKLER/FLASHERS 10/03/2011 18.86 18.86 10/14/2011

          Total 1120: 18,535.77 18,535.77

1125

Rifle Chamber Of Commerce

31-11-RCC REIMBURSEMENT ADVERTISIN 08/26/2011 1,386.32 1,386.32 10/21/2011



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     4

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 1125: 1,386.32 1,386.32

1126

Rifle City Of

1357101 1001 2416-22 RAIL AVE 10/01/2011 1,154.43 1,154.43 10/25/2011

1453101 1001 50 UTE AVE 10/01/2011 601.28 601.28 10/25/2011

2003101 1001 201 E. 18th st 10/01/2011 520.65 520.65 10/25/2011

2004101 1001 612 RAILROAD AVE 10/01/2011 520.69 520.69 10/25/2011

2005101 1001 1612 RAILROAD AVE 10/01/2011 918.98 918.98 10/25/2011

2006101 1001 101 S EAST AVE 10/01/2011 724.17 724.17 10/25/2011

2007101 1001 301 E 30TH ST 10/01/2011 127.51 127.51 10/25/2011

2033001 1001 750 UTE AVE 10/01/2011 118.30 118.30 10/25/2011

2038001 1001 0409 CR 265/POUND 10/01/2011 103.75 103.75 10/25/2011

2042001 1001 202 railroad ave 10/01/2011 224.22 224.22 10/25/2011

2046001 1001 143 E 4TH ST/DDA 10/01/2011 41.95 41.95 10/25/2011

2211101 1001 1201 RAILROAD AVE 10/01/2011 539.34 539.34 10/25/2011

2214101 1001 1500 DOGWOOD DR 10/01/2011 615.40 615.40 10/25/2011

2215101 1001 225 EAST AVE 10/01/2011 17.42 17.42 10/25/2011

2325101 1001 1500 DOGWOOD DR 10/01/2011 3.03 3.03 10/25/2011

2575101 1001 E 4TH ST 10/01/2011 59.37 59.37 10/25/2011

2975101 1001 1775 W CENTENNIAL PKWY 10/01/2011 17.42 17.42 10/25/2011

3079101 1001 595 W 24 TH ST 10/01/2011 573.39 573.39 10/25/2011

3221101 1001 000 BROWNING DR 10/01/2011 17.42 17.42 10/25/2011

3351101 1001 1221 E CENTENNIAL PKWY 10/01/2011 17.42 17.42 10/25/2011

3636101 1001 250 E 16TH ST 10/01/2011 130.29 130.29 10/25/2011

3641101 1001 360 S 7TH ST B 10/01/2011 17.42 17.42 10/25/2011

3673101 1001 3100 DOKES LN 10/01/2011 140.89 140.89 10/25/2011

3677101 10011 2515 WEST CENTENNIAL PARK 10/01/2011 2,559.73 2,559.73 10/25/2011

3679101 1001 300 W 5TH ST 10/01/2011 820.07 820.07 10/25/2011

823101 100111 202 railroad ave 10/01/2011 105.54 105.54 10/25/2011

873106 1001 132 E 4TH ST 10/01/2011 49.72 49.72 10/25/2011

873106 100111 236 w 4th st-Utilites Rental Proper 10/01/2011 66.96 66.96 10/25/2011

          Total 1126: 10,806.76 10,806.76

1132

Rifle Lock & Safe

31224 MASTER LOCK 10/19/2011 25.33 .00

          Total 1132: 25.33 .00

1143

Swallow Oil Company

101411 UNLEADED /FLEET 10/14/2011 4,309.77 .00

          Total 1143: 4,309.77 .00

1181

Garfield Steel & Machine, Inc

00078593 WRENCH CYLINDER 10/10/2011 1.60 .00

102011 1/8 X 2 STRIP 10/20/2011 59.73 .00

102011. 3/4X9 EXPANDED STD 10/20/2011 3.57 .00

          Total 1181: 64.90 .00

1188



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     5

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

Jean's Printing

112905 RED INK PADS 09/29/2011 15.00 .00

          Total 1188: 15.00 .00

1191

Lewan & Associates, Inc

922281 B&W METER 10/19/2011 502.61 .00

922282 B&W METER 10/19/2011 502.56 .00

922283 B&W METER 10/19/2011 502.56 .00

922284 B&W METER 10/19/2011 502.56 .00

          Total 1191: 2,010.29 .00

1235

Pina, Diego R

102611 REIMBURSE FOR MEALS/PD 10/26/2011 145.09 145.09 10/26/2011

          Total 1235: 145.09 145.09

1256

Resource Engineering, Inc

10171 341-10.15 ANTERO RESOURCE 09/30/2011 590.75 .00

10172 341-10.21 LARAMIE ENEGY 09/30/2011 316.74 .00

10173 341-10.22 BLACK DIAMOND WA 09/30/2011 223.49 .00

10175 341-10.4 WILLIAMS PRODUCTI 09/30/2011 490.49 .00

10176 ENCANA WATERSHED PERMIT 09/30/2011 851.21 .00

          Total 1256: 2,472.68 .00

1258

Hach Company

2063053 DEMINERALIZER CRTG 10/11/2011 230.00- .00

7451179 AMMONIA TNT ULR 10/06/2011 115.45 .00

7451180 LAMP REPLACEMENT ASSY LA 10/06/2011 322.52 .00

7451186 STABLCAL STD 10/06/2011 386.00 .00

7457107 AMMONIA TNT ULR 10/11/2011 131.25 .00

          Total 1258: 725.22 .00

1289

Galls, An Aramark Company

511658994 SWITCH MODULE 09/30/2011 27.99 .00

          Total 1289: 27.99 .00

1397

Western Implement Co

09290 SPRAYER PARTS 10/06/2011 82.14 .00

          Total 1397: 82.14 .00

1414

Sos Staffing Services Inc

1124538 TEMP STAFF/PLANNING 09/25/2011 171.60 171.60 10/14/2011

1128477 TEMP STAFF/PLANNING 10/02/2011 178.75 178.75 10/21/2011



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     6

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 1414: 350.35 350.35

1437

TAYLOR FENCE COMPANY OF GRAND  

G30480 CONST. PANEL RENTAL 09/30/2011 28.80 .00

G30481 CONST. PANEL RENTAL 09/30/2011 15.00 .00

          Total 1437: 43.80 .00

1460

Western Colorado Electrical  

4699 PO34732 10/21/2011 1,053.50 .00

          Total 1460: 1,053.50 .00

1560

Applied Concepts,inc

210838 STALKER MOVING FASTEST DI 10/12/2011 90.00 .00

          Total 1560: 90.00 .00

1768

Faris Machinery Company

G22139 AUTOMIZER 10/06/2011 1,525.97 .00

G22186 RUBBER BUMPER 10/13/2011 21.27 .00

T13201 RENTAL CONTRACT 10/06/2011 2,490.00 .00

          Total 1768: 4,037.24 .00

1806

CDMS INC

8674 DSL ACCESS - Cemetery 10/01/2011 17.95 .00

          Total 1806: 17.95 .00

1830

Grand Valley Foods

117242 FOOD PRODUCT/SR CENTER 10/14/2011 513.78 .00

117364 FOOD PRODUCT/SR CENTER 10/21/2011 174.37 .00

          Total 1830: 688.15 .00

1990

Bookcliff Survey Services, Inc

7976 RIFLE CREEK PLAZA 10/06/2011 2,040.00 .00

          Total 1990: 2,040.00 .00

2122

Utility Notification Center Co

21109627 RTL TRANSMISSIONS 09/30/2011 83.72 .00

          Total 2122: 83.72 .00

2181

Nalco Chemical Company

96177282 Drum 210 LITER 10/06/2011 2,202.62 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     7

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 2181: 2,202.62 .00

2235

Acme Alarm Company Inc

101411 Update fire alarm devices 10/14/2011 4,740.00 4,740.00 10/14/2011

          Total 2235: 4,740.00 4,740.00

2343

Mountain Pest Control

0275392 PEST CONTROL 10/05/2011 50.00 .00

          Total 2343: 50.00 .00

2353

Colo Dept. Of Revenue

101011 2011 STATE AND COUNTY TAX 10/10/2011 137.00 137.00 10/14/2011

101011. STATE TAX LICENSE -BOOKLE 10/10/2011 16.00 16.00 10/14/2011

          Total 2353: 153.00 153.00

2405

Glenwood Radiator Co

5523 REPLACE GASKETS 10/14/2011 300.00 .00

          Total 2405: 300.00 .00

2409

Reserve Account

100311 POSTAGE 10/03/2011 4,441.54 4,441.54 10/14/2011

          Total 2409: 4,441.54 4,441.54

2491

Western Colorado Truck Center

108232A TRANSMISSION 09/29/2011 61.57 .00

108286A HUBCAP 10/03/2011 100.70 .00

108322A TRANSMISSION 10/04/2011 59.57 .00

108324A COOLANT 10/04/2011 110.94 .00

          Total 2491: 332.78 .00

2573

Mountain West Office Products

265368 supplies 10/20/2011 9.25 .00

265546I supplies 10/06/2011 107.33 .00

265687 supplies 10/10/2011 29.99 .00

265870I supplies 10/13/2011 22.27 .00

266104I supplies 10/19/2011 769.34 .00

266105I supplies 10/19/2011 50.03 .00

266113I supplies 10/21/2011 19.79 .00

          Total 2573: 1,008.00 .00

2690

Down Valley Septic & Drain LLC

SEPT110014 ROLL OFF - TIP /CEMETARY 09/30/2011 200.00 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     8

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 2690: 200.00 .00

2694

Gould Construction

102711 Rifle Bond Bypass Pipeline 10/27/2011 22,291.00 .00

          Total 2694: 22,291.00 .00

2846

Colo Mtn News Media

6943991 ADS 09/08/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6943991 0901 ADS 09/01/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6943991 0915 ADS 09/15/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6943991 0922 ADS 09/22/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6943991 0929 ADS 09/29/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6944020 0901 ADS 09/01/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

6977003 09081 ADS 09/08/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

7000700 0915 ADS 09/15/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

7013279 0922 ADS 09/22/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

7052971 0929 ADS 09/29/2011 165.69 165.69 10/14/2011

          Total 2846: 1,656.90 1,656.90

2960

Walmart Community

003018 SUPPLIES 10/03/2011 25.26 25.26 10/14/2011

012835. FOOD SUPPLIES 10/12/2011 15.49 15.49 10/21/2011

012924 SUPPLIES 10/12/2011 56.74 56.74 10/14/2011

015983 CHILD CARE FITNESS CENTER 10/15/2011 62.67 62.67 10/21/2011

019294 FOOD SUPPLIES 10/19/2011 77.46 77.46 10/21/2011

          Total 2960: 237.62 237.62

2970

Diamond Vogel Paints

751099402 SUPER LINE WHITE TRAFFIC 10/20/2011 217.00 .00

          Total 2970: 217.00 .00

3015

Kroger/King Sooper Cust Charge

042672 FOOD /SR CENTER 10/17/2011 37.64 37.64 10/21/2011

085318 FOOD /SR CENTER 10/18/2011 12.00 12.00 10/21/2011

115173 SUPPLIES 10/18/2011 111.30 111.30 10/21/2011

127704 FOOD /SR CENTER 10/05/2011 51.57 51.57 10/14/2011

129854 FOOD-MEETING 10/12/2011 18.85 18.85 10/21/2011

170155 M&C MEETING 10/19/2011 39.44 39.44 10/21/2011

189819 FOOD /SR CENTER 10/20/2011 18.76 18.76 10/21/2011

407699 PRAB MEETING 10/10/2011 53.13 53.13 10/14/2011

430683 M&C MEETING 10/10/2011 11.88 11.88 10/21/2011

445346 FOOD /SR CENTER 10/10/2011 49.27 49.27 10/21/2011

          Total 3015: 403.84 403.84

3083

ALSCO

1066313 work shirts and pants 09/27/2011 27.24 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     9

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

1069340 work shirts and pants 10/04/2011 27.64 .00

1072216 LAUNDRY/senior center 10/11/2011 53.33 .00

1075010 LAUNDRY/senior center 10/18/2011 50.86 .00

          Total 3083: 159.07 .00

3156

Superwash Of Rifle

2008 092111 CAR WASH 09/21/2011 12.53 .00

2008 100411 CAR WASH 10/04/2011 12.53 .00

2025 092111 CAR WASH 09/21/2011 168.32 .00

2025 100411 CAR WASH 10/04/2011 113.79 .00

          Total 3156: 307.17 .00

3190

Cascade Engineering

30029440 CART 64 GRY/NO LOGO CITY 10/06/2011 6,418.00 .00

          Total 3190: 6,418.00 .00

3195

Frontier Paving Inc

102411 CONSTRUCTION 2011 STREET  10/24/2011 164,757.00 .00

102411. CONSTRUCTION 2011 STREET  10/24/2011 79,743.10 .00

          Total 3195: 244,500.10 .00

3707

Interstate Battery System Inc

22031512 BATTERIES 10/19/2011 197.90 .00

          Total 3707: 197.90 .00

3735

Super Wash Of Rifle

2036 092111 CAR WASH 09/21/2011 22.11 .00

          Total 3735: 22.11 .00

3771

Waste Management Inc

0665001-1185- RIFLE MOUNTAIN PARK 10/01/2011 751.15 .00

0665002-1185- CONTAINER SERVICE FEE 10/01/2011 137.25 .00

0667691-1185- 20 YD ROLL OFF 10/01/2011 28.45 .00

1117793-0576- Recycling Service 10/01/2011 2,122.40 .00

1117794-0576- Recycling Service 10/01/2011 2,206.35 .00

1117795-0576- Recycling Service 10/01/2011 553.82 .00

          Total 3771: 5,799.42 .00

3780

Concrete Equipment

123125 DURASOFT FLOAT HANDLE 10/10/2011 9.78 .00

          Total 3780: 9.78 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     10

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

3955

Holy Cross Energy

090411 BEAVER CREEK HEADGATE 09/04/2011 37.17 37.17 10/14/2011

090411. Baron Lane St Lights 09/04/2011 19.58 19.58 10/14/2011

          Total 3955: 56.75 56.75

3972

Hier, John

101011 MEALS COUNCIL MEETING 10/10/2011 74.23 74.23 10/14/2011

          Total 3972: 74.23 74.23

4055

UPS/United Parcel Service

0000Y2097W4 SHIPPING 10/08/2011 8.52 .00

          Total 4055: 8.52 .00

4098

Heuton Tire Co

91767 TIRES/.FLEET 10/21/2011 1,559.12 .00

          Total 4098: 1,559.12 .00

4119

Air Compressor Services

25336 PLASTIC INSERTS 10/11/2011 5.37 .00

          Total 4119: 5.37 .00

4141

True Brew Coffee Service

137729 COFFEE 10/05/2011 128.80 .00

137730 COFFEE 10/05/2011 56.93 .00

137979 COFFEE 10/21/2011 37.95 .00

          Total 4141: 223.68 .00

4181

Crown Awards

31379680 SOCCER MEDALS 10/10/2011 313.70 .00

          Total 4181: 313.70 .00

4184

Winston Associates Inc

32051 PROJECT 72400 09/30/2011 934.52 .00

32052 PROJECT 72401-1 2ND ST & W 09/30/2011 1,372.04 .00

32053 PROJECT 72402 09/30/2011 1,398.90 .00

32054 PROJECT 72403 09/30/2011 100.00 .00

          Total 4184: 3,805.46 .00

4215

Ziegler, James

60464 SUPERCUFF IMPCT GLV 10/14/2011 5.66 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     11

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 4215: 5.66 .00

4240

Platinum Plus For Business

BRAATEN 091 CML POLICY COMMITEE MEETI 09/12/2011 848.72 848.72 10/21/2011

BRIEDES 0912 CPRA SPRING SUMMIT 09/12/2011 387.00 387.00 10/21/2011

CAIN 091211 SHRM MEMBERSHIP 09/12/2011 583.16 583.16 10/21/2011

CHRISTENSE M&C MEETING 09/12/2011 484.53 484.53 10/21/2011

EDGETON 091 KOLBALT TAPE 09/12/2011 49.92 49.92 10/21/2011

GALLEGOS 09 CONFERENCE 09/12/2011 193.65 193.65 10/21/2011

JONES 091211 EXPENSES 09/12/2011 35.50 35.50 10/21/2011

KEHOE 09121 APPLE AP 09/12/2011 4,356.29 4,356.29 10/21/2011

KELTY 091211 CONFERENCE 09/12/2011 381.91 381.91 10/21/2011

KUPER 09121 TRAINING 09/12/2011 81.53 81.53 10/21/2011

LAMBERT 091 CML POLICY COMMITEE MEETI 09/12/2011 271.32 271.32 10/21/2011

MEISNER 091 ITUNES STORE APPLICATIONS 09/12/2011 76.92 76.92 10/21/2011

PINA 092111 IPHONE ASSESSORIES 09/21/2011 770.58 770.58 10/21/2011

RYAN 091211 SASR 50 BMG TRAINING 09/12/2011 102.58 102.58 10/21/2011

SHANAHAN 09 EXPENSES 09/12/2011 225.28 225.28 10/21/2011

STEWART 091 K-9 LEGAL UPDATE TRAINING 09/12/2011 320.45 320.45 10/21/2011

STURGEON 0 CONFERENCING 09/12/2011 .03 .03 10/21/2011

WHITMORE 09 SUPPLIES 09/12/2011 407.87 407.87 10/21/2011

          Total 4240: 9,577.24 9,577.24

4244

Boogie Down Light And Sound Inc.

101411 SOUND SYSTEM RIFLE FALL F 10/14/2011 400.00 400.00 10/14/2011

          Total 4244: 400.00 400.00

4288

Native American Crane Svs Inc

11-174 BOOM TRUCK 10/05/2011 300.00 .00

          Total 4288: 300.00 .00

4339

Design Concepts

0014453 Deerfield Park Construction Drawi 10/05/2011 11,417.15 .00

          Total 4339: 11,417.15 .00

4602

Anytime Sewer & Drain Company

722098 REPAIR 10/01/2011 315.00 .00

          Total 4602: 315.00 .00

4630

Kirkman, Ula

74 PERFORMANCE/SR CENTER 10/11/2011 75.00 75.00 10/21/2011

          Total 4630: 75.00 75.00

4734



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     12

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

Vandewalle & Associates, Inc.

201107036 CONCEPT PLAN BUSINESS PL 07/31/2011 2,143.30 .00

          Total 4734: 2,143.30 .00

4753

Rifle Truck & Trailer

4252 DETENT BALL PIN 10/06/2011 4.50 .00

4275 2004 POLARIS RANGER CHECK  10/11/2011 244.48 .00

          Total 4753: 248.98 .00

4771

Walker Jan

30 PERFORMANCE/SR CENTER 10/06/2011 40.00 40.00 10/14/2011

          Total 4771: 40.00 40.00

4811

United Site Services Inc

114-198527 PORTABLE RESTROOM METR 09/26/2011 130.00 .00

114-198528 PORTABLE RESTROOM -MOUN 09/26/2011 1,295.00 .00

          Total 4811: 1,425.00 .00

4869

My Precious Pet

100 FISH TANK/SR CENTER 10/06/2011 65.00 65.00 10/14/2011

          Total 4869: 65.00 65.00

4882

Informed Publishing (creative

15902 NIMS-2ND EDITION 10/11/2011 72.00 .00

          Total 4882: 72.00 .00

4926

Ge Capital

56313891 KIP PRINTER 10/09/2011 391.49 .00

          Total 4926: 391.49 .00

4963

Intellipay Inc

164 transaction fee 10/03/2011 112.49 112.49 10/14/2011

          Total 4963: 112.49 112.49

4967

Touch Tone Communications

092811 OM 09/28/2011 222.68 222.68 10/14/2011

          Total 4967: 222.68 222.68

5181

FRED'S HARDWARE

177132 SUPPLIES 08/11/2011 56.99 56.99 10/21/2011



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     13

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

20300 093011 SUPPLIES 09/30/2011 109.14 .00

          Total 5181: 166.13 56.99

5240

A-1 HEATING & COOLING INC

15327 FLASHING CITY HALL 10/04/2011 50.00 .00

          Total 5240: 50.00 .00

5253

FASTENAL

44488 CB 1/2-13X3 Z 10/04/2011 34.65 .00

44490 NRR32 BGFOAM EAR PLUG 10/04/2011 19.11 .00

44567 DISFOAMERPLUGSCOR 10/06/2011 48.72 .00

44639 3/8 X14HT TOWPACKAGED 10/11/2011 115.57 .00

44641 3/8X14 HT TOWPACKAGED 10/11/2011 138.65 .00

44684 25 ROCKRIVER TAPEME 10/12/2011 21.53 .00

          Total 5253: 378.23 .00

5365

American Windshield Repair

7079 windshield repair 10/10/2011 45.00 .00

7294 windshield repair 10/19/2011 380.00 .00

          Total 5365: 425.00 .00

5413

Bruno, Colin, Jewell & Lowe PC

120358 Legal Fees 09/30/2011 27.00 .00

          Total 5413: 27.00 .00

5454

KINSCO

4332 TASER HOLSTER 10/11/2011 216.50 .00

          Total 5454: 216.50 .00

5503

JAY-MAX SALES

211990-00 FLAT  WASHER GR 8 10/12/2011 39.25 .00

          Total 5503: 39.25 .00

5548

Power Equipment Company

G110050328 FILTER ELEMENT 10/11/2011 63.15 .00

          Total 5548: 63.15 .00

5600

BIG IRON TIRE SERVICE LLC

11114 BIAS REPAIR 07/20/2011 333.00 .00

          Total 5600: 333.00 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     14

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

5748

CTL THOMPSON

322597 2011 STREET IMPROVEMENTS  09/30/2011 1,714.00 .00

          Total 5748: 1,714.00 .00

5752

Accutest Mountain States

D9-21034 alkalinity, organic carbon/water te 10/06/2011 1,160.00 .00

          Total 5752: 1,160.00 .00

5754

GARFIELD COUNTY HUMAN SERVICES

100411 SENIOR WELLNESS 10/04/2011 87.74 87.74 10/14/2011

100711 SENIOR WELLNESS 10/07/2011 22.50 22.50 10/21/2011

          Total 5754: 110.24 110.24

5839

GOODWIN SERVICES, INC

51407 PUMP OIL WATER SEPERTOR 10/13/2011 1,000.00 .00

          Total 5839: 1,000.00 .00

5846

Mesa County Health Department  

3756-11 Water Testing 10/11/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

3757-11 Water Testing 10/11/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

3758-11 Water Testing 10/11/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

3759-11 Water Testing 10/11/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

3760-11 Water Testing 10/11/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

          Total 5846: 100.00 100.00

5895

STANDARD REGISTER COMPANY

38139860 BILL OF SALE 10/01/2011 56.80 .00

          Total 5895: 56.80 .00

5907

ASPEN VALLEY HARLEY-DAVIDON

213973 ASM FILTER 10/20/2011 59.66 .00

          Total 5907: 59.66 .00

5958

Utility Refund

1476104 REFUND 10/06/2011 63.48 63.48 10/14/2011

1701101 REFUND 10/06/2011 49.64 49.64 10/14/2011

177102 REFUND 09/30/2011 81.41 81.41 10/14/2011

3318103 REFUND 09/30/2011 20.00 20.00 10/14/2011

          Total 5958: 214.53 214.53

5994



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     15

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

Schouten, Roger

101611 WORK BOOTS 10/16/2011 100.00 100.00 10/21/2011

          Total 5994: 100.00 100.00

6040

AIS Industrial & Construction Supply

440514-00 TAPE 10/12/2011 290.47 .00

440970-00 SKT 10/17/2011 25.95 .00

          Total 6040: 316.42 .00

6043

Wilkins Angie

093011 MILEAGE REIMBURSEMENT 09/30/2011 41.80 41.80 10/14/2011

          Total 6043: 41.80 41.80

6089

SGM

102011 CONFERENCE FALL FORUM SE 10/20/2011 100.00 100.00 10/21/2011

          Total 6089: 100.00 100.00

6102

SENSUS

ZA12008040 SENSUS SYSTEM SUPPORT 09/13/2011 1,452.00 .00

          Total 6102: 1,452.00 .00

6108

Browns Hill Engineering & Cont, LLC

5353 SERVICE WORK 10/07/2011 1,801.30 .00

5378 SERVICE WORK 10/14/2011 2,031.30 .00

5400 SERVICE WORK 10/21/2011 1,657.55 .00

          Total 6108: 5,490.15 .00

6137

Impressions of Aspen

14800 SUPPLIES 10/13/2011 246.23 .00

          Total 6137: 246.23 .00

6152

CSI-Citadel Security & Investigations

4264 EVENT SECURITY 10/17/2011 528.75 .00

          Total 6152: 528.75 .00

6225

BRUBACHER DESIGN

368 SGNAGE NEW THEATER 10/04/2011 401.58 .00

373 STOP SIGNS 10/13/2011 431.22 .00

          Total 6225: 832.80 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     16

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

6318

Oasis Irrigation Company

5950 ARNOLD 375- WILL AVE 10/16/2011 50.00 .00

5951 WHEELER 550 ASPEN AVE 10/16/2011 134.50 .00

5952 RENERO 1109 FIRETHORN CT 10/16/2011 149.37 .00

5953 DAHL 1264 FIR AVE 10/16/2011 81.00 .00

          Total 6318: 414.87 .00

6332

DIRECTV

16124246852 DTV-FITNESS CENTER 09/29/2011 109.99 109.99 10/14/2011

          Total 6332: 109.99 109.99

6346

D.L. ADAMS ASSOCIATES, INC

19748 NEW UTE THEATRE 10/12/2011 3,603.85 .00

          Total 6346: 3,603.85 .00

6357

FIRST STRING

3994 T-SHIRTS 10/13/2011 253.75 .00

          Total 6357: 253.75 .00

6383

CENTURY LINK

1183286965 OM 09/30/2011 551.99 551.99 10/14/2011

1184650982 FITNESS CENTER 10/11/2011 9.21 9.21 10/21/2011

          Total 6383: 561.20 561.20

6394

ALLSTATE ENVIRONMENTAL

0911-01 WEED KILLER 09/20/2011 2,401.00 .00

          Total 6394: 2,401.00 .00

6402

CENTURY LINK

970625004 OM 10/01/2011 446.67 446.67 10/14/2011

9706250115 POLICE 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250163 WW 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250164 STREETS 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250165 WATER 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250166 PARKS 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250183 POLICE 10/01/2011 282.36 282.36 10/14/2011

9706250267 POLICE 10/01/2011 295.86 295.86 10/14/2011

          Total 6402: 2,436.69 2,436.69

6405

TALENTWISE

49860787 BACKGROUND CHECKS 09/30/2011 1,759.45 .00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     17

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

          Total 6405: 1,759.45 .00

6429

Enterprise FM Trust

100511 REFUND SALES TAX 10/05/2011 4,128.65 4,128.65 10/14/2011

          Total 6429: 4,128.65 4,128.65

6430

Frog and Toad

101411 SOUND EQUIMPENT-RIFLE FAL 10/14/2011 200.00 200.00 10/14/2011

          Total 6430: 200.00 200.00

6431

Cavaliere, Julie

101411 PERFORMANCE RIFLE FALL FE 10/14/2011 600.00 600.00 10/14/2011

          Total 6431: 600.00 600.00

6432

Pieplow, Sarah

101411 PERFORMANCE RIFLE FALL FE 10/14/2011 600.00 600.00 10/14/2011

          Total 6432: 600.00 600.00

6433

Kuhlmann, Nick

101411 PERFORMANCE RIFLE FALL FE 10/14/2011 900.00 900.00 10/14/2011

          Total 6433: 900.00 900.00

6434

Spruce Creek Multimedia

276 WEB SITE PHOTOGRAPHY 10/01/2011 525.00 525.00 10/21/2011

          Total 6434: 525.00 525.00

6435

ARMA INTERNATIONAL

269436 RENEWAL MEMBER ID 128928 10/04/2011 210.00 210.00 10/21/2011

          Total 6435: 210.00 210.00

6436

Sunny Dunn-Linn

102011 SUPPLIES SR WELLNESS 10/20/2011 9.48 9.48 10/21/2011

          Total 6436: 9.48 9.48

6437

Hall, Ron

102011 REFUND CEMETERY 10/20/2011 200.00 200.00 10/20/2011

          Total 6437: 200.00 200.00



City of Rifle Payment Approval Report - Summary - Rifle Page:     18

Report dates: 10/14/2011-10/27/2011 Oct 27, 2011  11:18AM

Vendor Name and Number Invoice Number Description Invoice Date Net Invoice Amount Amount Paid Date Paid

6438

TY STRIPING

1407 STRIPING 10/07/2011 454.32 .00

          Total 6438: 454.32 .00

6439

SimplexGrinnell

40381369 KEY CARDS 10/10/2011 404.00 .00

          Total 6439: 404.00 .00

          Grand Totals:  549,563.66 64,774.15

             Dated:  __________________________________________

City Finance Director:  __________________________________________

Report Criteria:

Summary report.

Invoices with totals above $0 included.

Paid and unpaid invoices included.



 

 
 

 
 

Sander N. Karp 

James S. Neu 

Karl J. Hanlon 

Michael J. Sawyer 

James F. Fosnaught 

Greg S. Russi, 

Of Counsel 

 

 
 

 
 

Anna S. Itenberg 

Cassia R. Furman 

T. Damien Zumbrennen 

Jeffrey J. Conklin 

 
201 14

th
 Street, Suite 200 

P. O. Drawer  2030 

Glenwood Springs, CO 81602 

Telephone: (970) 945-2261 

Facsimile: (970) 945-7336 

www.mountainlawfirm.com 

 

James S. Neu 
jsn@mountainlawfirm.com 

 

October 27, 2011   
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 

Mayor Jay Miller 

Rifle City Council 

P. O. Box 1908 

Rifle, Colorado  81650 

    

 Re: November 2, 2011 City Council Meeting 

     

Dear Mayor Miller and Members of the Rifle City Council: 

 

 The purpose of this letter is to briefly outline the discussion we will have at the November 2, 

2011 Rifle City Council Meeting. 

 

1. Ordinance Nos. 11, 13, 14, 15, Series of 2011 Second Reading Ratification on Consent 

Agenda.  At your last meeting you passed Ordinance Nos. 11, 13, 14, 15, Series of 2011 on second 

reading.  Unfortunately, the Glenwood Post Independent failed to publish these ordinances by title 

following first reading in the timeframe require by the City’s Charter.  Charter Section 4.3(e) states that 

ordinances shall be considered on second reading not earlier than seven days after publication for final 

passage or rejection by a roll call vote of the Council.  In this case the paper published the titles six (6) 

days before your October 19th meeting.  Therefore, we have published these ordinances by title once 

again on October 24, 2011 to comply with the Charter, and they are on your consent agenda to officially 

pass them on second reading at your November 2nd meeting.  The Council has fully considered these 

items at two meetings, so it is appropriate to include them on the consent agenda, subject to the request 

of any Council member to consider any of the ordinances as a regular action item.  The City Clerk will 

then publish the ordinances in full as required by the Charter. 

 

We recommend approval of Ordinance Nos. 11, 13, 14, and 15, Series of 2011 on second 

reading and as part of the consent agenda. 

 

2. Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 (Adoption of the 2009 International Building Codes).  

In 2004 and 2006, the City adopted by reference, and with amendments, various building codes 

comprising the International Building Codes family, 2003 Edition.  The International Building Codes 

provide a comprehensive framework for regulation of new and existing structures in the City.  In 2009, 

the International Code Council released a new set of documents which update and revise the 2003 

Edition codes.  City staff has reviewed the 2009 Edition codes extensively and recommends adopting 

the updated codes with official commentaries and amendments, Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 

accomplishes.  One exception is the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition, which contains much more 

stringent sprinkling requirements than the 2003 Edition. For the time being, the City will continue 



KARP NEU HANLON, P.C. 

 

Mayor Jay Miller 

Rifle City Council 

Page 2 

 

 

operating under the 2003 Edition of the International Fire Code.  Along the same lines, staff proposes 

that automatic residential fire sprinkler systems not be required at this time for one- and two-family 

dwellings under the International Residential Code with the caveat that if an automatic fire sprinkler 

system is not installed in a two-family dwelling, a two-hour separation between units is required.  

Sprinkling is required for structures with three or more dwelling units.  Ordinance No. 12 contains this 

amendment made since first reading on page 6 in RMC Section 18-3-30(4).   Ordinance No. 12 also 

eliminates the Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings at Article VII of Chapter 18.  

Regulation of dangerous buildings is now covered by the International Property Maintenance Code at 

Article XI.   

 

C.R.S. §31-16-201, et seq. governs the adoption of codes by reference and includes specific 

public notice requirements after introduction of the ordinance by the City Council.  To comply with the 

statutory framework, we have published two notices of the public hearing which will be held at this 

meeting. 
  

We recommend approval of Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 on second reading following a 

public hearing. 

 

3. Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 (Amending Section 6-5-100 of the Liquor Code 

Regarding the Suspension of Liquor Licenses).  The State performed a liquor license compliance check 

last year that resulted in several violations that we have discussed with you in the past.  Since then, the 

Rifle Police Department followed up with its own compliance check that resulted in additional 

violations at the local level.  The City Clerk and my office are working on enforcement actions under 

the City’s Liquor Code when we found a limitation in RMC Section 6-5-100 that only authorizes the 

suspension or revocation of licenses.  Suspension and revocation may not always be appropriate when 

reviewing the severity of the violation.  Speaking with the Chief we do not know of any policy reason 

this limitation exists as it takes away some enforcement tools the City may want to utilize in specific 

situations.  The State often enters into a stipulation with a license holder that requires the payment of a 

fine to stay a suspension.  Staff believes that the City should have the same ability and state statute 

specifically authorizes fines if a local jurisdiction provides for them by ordinance.  Therefore, we 

recommend that the City Council amend Section 6-5-100 as proposed in Ordinance No. 16, Series of 

2011. 

We recommend approval of Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 on first reading. 

4.  Contract with Bureau of Reclamation for 200 Acre Feet of Ruedi Reservoir Water.  

Please see the separate memo in your packet regarding the Contract with Bureau of Reclamation for 200 

Acre Feet of Ruedi Reservoir Water. 

5. Approval of Recording Notice and Affidavit of Default Regarding Rifle Heights 

Subdivision.  The Developer of Rifle Heights Subdivision informed the City that his project will be 



KARP NEU HANLON, P.C. 

 

Mayor Jay Miller 

Rifle City Council 

Page 3 

 

 

going into foreclosure in the near future.  Only Phase 1 has been developed and all associated public 

improvements have been constructed.  The only outstanding obligation for Phase 1 under the SIA is the 

payment of costs related to the reconstruction of Whiteriver Avenue adjacent to the Property in the 

amount of $159,101.70which came due on August 21, 2011.  The City has not scheduled the 

reconstruction of Whiteriver Avenue so it was going to hold the funds for that future project.  The City 

Council amended the due date of that payment several times in light of the Recession, but with the 

looming foreclosure, there is no reason to extend it again. With this default of the SIA, we are recording 

the enclosed Notice and Affidavit of Default to put the world on notice of the default so any future 

owner is aware of the outstanding obligation.  No future phases of the subdivision can be approved and 

no sale of lots owned by the Developer may occur until this default is cured.  The Affidavit does not 

affect lots owned by third parties in any way.  The SIA requires that the City Council approve the 

recording of the Affidavit and that is why it is on your Consent Agenda. 

 

 As always, please feel free to call us prior to the meeting if you have any questions.  

 

 Very truly yours, 

 

 KARP NEU HANLON, P.C. 

 

  

 

 James S. Neu 

JSN: 

Enclosure   



 

 

 

To:    Mayor and City Council; John Hier, City Manager 
 
From:   Lisa Cain, City Clerk 
 
Date:   Friday, October 28, 2011  
  
Subject:  Special Event Permit:  BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 
 
BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 has applied for a Special Event Permit to serve liquor at the Rifle Fire Protection District’s 
Holiday Event at 501 Airport Road on December 10, 2011. 
 
The following criteria have been met by the applicant: 

• The fees have been paid. 
• The application is complete.  
• The applicant has not exceeded 15 permit days this year. 

 
The Public Hearing was properly noticed on the premises. Representatives from the applicant and Rifle Fire Protection 
District will be present to discuss the application and answer questions. 
  
Based on the above information, I recommend approval of this application. 



DR 8439 (06/28106)
COLORADODEPARTMENTOFREVENUE APPLICATION FOR A SPECIALLIQUOR ENFORCEMENT DIVISION
1375 SHERMAN STREET EVENTS PERMITDENVER CO 80261
(3031205-2300

IN ORDER TO QUALIFY FOR A SPECIAL EVENTS PERMIT, YOU MUST BE NONPROFIT
AND ONE OF THE FOLLOWING (See back for details.)

Q SOCIAL [I ATHLETIC [1 PHILANTHROPIC INSTITUTION

J FRATERNAL CHARTERED BRANCH, LODGE OR CHAPTER J POLITICAL CANDIDATE

[1 PATRIOTIC [] OF A NATIONAL ORGANIZATION OR SOCIETY [] MUNICIPALITY OWNING ARTS

El POLITICAL LJ RELIGIOUS INSTITUTION FACILITIES

UAB TYPE OF SPECIAL EVENT APPUCANT IS APPLYING FOR: DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE
2110 MALT, VINOUS AND SPIRITUOUS LIQUOR $25.00 PER DAY LIQUOR PERMIT NUMBER

2170 FERMENTED MALT BEVERAGE (3.2 Beer) $10.00 PER DAY

1. NAME OF APPLICANT ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE State Sales Tax Number (RequIred)

BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 04-09357-0000
2. MAILING ADDRESS OF ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE 3. ADDRESS OF PLACE TO HAVE SPECIAL EVENT

(indude street, dty/town and ZIP) (indude street, dtyltown and ZIP)

P0 Box 1229 501 Airport Road
Rifle CO 81650 Rifle CO 81650

NAME DATE OF BIRTH HOME ADDRESS (Street, CIty, State, ZIP) PHONE NUMBER

4. PRES.ISEC’Y OF ORG. or POLITICAL CANDIDATE

Nancy Bayne, Secretary
5. EVENT MANAGER

Nancy Bayne
6. HAS APPLICANT ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE BEEN 7. IS PREMISES NOW LICENSED UNDER STATE LIQUOR OR BEER CODE?

ISSUED A SPECIAL EVENT PERMIT THIS CALENDAR YEAR?

NO YES HOW MANY DAYS? 8 —

NO YES TO WHOM?

8. DOES THE APPLICANT HAVE POSSESSION OR WRITrEN PERMISSION FOR THE USE OF THE PREMISES TO BE LICENSED? Yes [El No

LIST BELOW THE EXACT DATE(S) FOR WHICH APPLICATION IS BEING MADE FOR PERMIT

Date 1 2-10-201 1 Date Date Date Date

Hours From 5:00 p rn. Hours From rn. Hours From .m. Hours From rn. Hours From rn.

To Midnight.m. To rn. To rn. To .m. To rn.

OATH OF APPLICANT
I declare under penalty of perjury in the second degree that I have read the foregoing application and all attachments thereto, and
that all information therein is true, correct, and complete to the best of my knowledge.

SIGNATURTh 7) jTITLE DATE

Secretary 10-18-2011

REP T ANWAPPROVAL OF LOCAL LICENSING AUTHORITY (CITY OR COUNTY)
The foregoing application has been examined and the premises, business conducted and character of the applicant is satisfactory,
and we do report that such permit, if granted, will comply with the provisions of Title 12, Article 48, C.R.S., as amended.

ThEREFORE, ThiS APP LICA11ON IS APPROVED.
LOCAL LICENSING AUTHORITY (CITY OR COUNTY) [] crry TELEPHONE NUMBER OF CITYOUNTY CLERK

El COUNTY
SIGNATURE TITLE DATE

DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE - FOR DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE USE ONLY

UABIUTY INFORMATION

License Account Number LiabilIty Date State TOTAL

-750 (999) $

Department Use Only

(Instructions on Reverse Size)



Grand River Hospital District



Hospital Services I Family

October 18, 2011

River Hospital District
Medicine Women’s Health I Speciafly Services I Long Term Care I Occupational Health Sen’ices

To Whom It May Concern:

Permission is granted for the BPOE Lodge Rifle Elks Lodge #2195 to hove a
Special Events Permit for alcoholic beverages during the Rifle Fire
Protection District’s Holiday Event to be held on Grand River Hospital
District’s premises on Saturday, December 10, 2011.

Please contact me if you have any questions or need further information.

Sincerely,

mes C. Coombs, Jr., CEO
Grand River Hospital District

Grand Ruer Hosta and Medical Center 970.625,1510, 501 Ai,port Road, Rifle I Bafflement Mesa Medical Center 970.285,7046, 73 Sipprelle Drive, Suite K Parachute
Grand River Health a Safety Center 970285.5731, 71 Sipprelie Drive, Unit], Parachute I F. Dane Moore Care Center 970.625.1514, 701 East 5th Street, Rifle



City of Rifle

Special Events Liquor Permit Application

Name of Applicant / Organization: S, - / * L /< # / C) S

Thank you for your interest in a Special Event in the City of Rifle. In addition to the State Application
(Form #DR 8439), the following information must be provided in order for your application to be
considered. Incomplete applications will be rejected. Please do not hesitate to contact the City Clerk with
questions at (970) 665-6405.

1. The City requires that a Special Events Permit application be received no later than 45 days prior
to the event. What is the date(s) of your event?

___________________________________________________

2. What security measures have you taken to ensure your event will be safe for all participants and
control entry of under age persons? J I D’

3. Per Rifle Municipal Code 6-5-170(a)(3), the City requires that at least one server, manager, or
owner/operator, including volunteers, who has successfully completed an approved educational liquor
serving seminar, is present at all times and is supervising the dispensing of alcoholic beverages. What is
the name of the person(s) who has this certification and will be on the premises the entire time of your
event?

\r -----—

4. Have you included the appropriate fees with your application?

________________

Fees: For Malt, Vinous, and Spirituous Liquor
Check payable to the City ofRWe for $25.00 per day

Fees: For Fermented Malt Beverage (3.2% Beer)
Check payable to the City ofRUle for $10.00 per day

5. Does your diagram of the intended licensed premises include:

_______

Measurements/dimensions of the area to be licensed?

______

Points of ingress/egress?
An outline in red of the area to be licensed?

6. Please provide a copy of a deed, lease, or written permission of the owner(s) for use of the
premises.

7. I have read the Rifle Municipal Code provisions regarding (copies of these sections are attached to
this form):

______

Section 10.8.50 and Section 10.8.60 (7)No minors allowed on licensed premises

______

Section 10.8.80 Open container law

______

Section 6.5.170 Educational requirements for Licensees

Siature: Date: ‘ )



 

 

 

To:    Mayor and City Council; John Hier, City Manager 
 
From:   Lisa Cain, City Clerk 
 
Date:   Friday, October 28, 2011  
  
Subject:  Special Event Permit:  BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 
 
BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 has applied for a Special Event Permit to serve liquor at the City of Rifle’s Holiday Event at 
501 Airport Road on December 16, 2011. 
 
The following criteria have been met by the applicant: 

• The fees have been paid. 
• The application is complete.  
• The applicant has not exceeded 15 permit days this year. 

 
The Public Hearing was properly noticed on the premises. Representatives from the applicant will be present to discuss 
the application and answer questions. 
  
Based on the above information, I recommend approval of this application. 



UAB TYPE OF SPECIAL EVENT APPUCANT IS APPLYING FOR: DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE
2110 MALT, VINOUS AND SPIRITUOUS LIQUOR $25.00 PER DAY LIQUOR PERMIT NUMBER

2170 FERMENTED MALT BEVERAGE (3.2 Beer) $10.00 PER DAY

1. NAME OF APPLICANT ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE State Sales Tax Number (RequIred)
BPOE Lodge Rifle Lodge #2195 04-09357-0000

2. MAILING ADDRESS OF ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE 3. ADDRESS OF PLACE TO HAVE SPECIAL EVENT
(include street, cltyltown arid ZIP) (Include street, cltyftown and ZIP)

P0 Box 1229 501 Airport Road
Rifle CO 81650 Rifle CO 81650

NAME DATE OF BIRTH HOME ADDRESS (Street, CIty. State, ZIP) PHONE NUMBER

4. PRES.ISEC’Y OF ORG. or POLITICAL CANDIDATE

Nancy_Bayne,_Secretary
5. EVENT MANAGER

Nancy Bayne
6. HAS APPLICANT ORGANIZATION OR POLITICAL CANDIDATE BEEN 7. IS PREMISES NOW LICENSED UNDER STATE LIQUOR OR BEER CODE?

ISSUED A SPECIAL EVENT PERMIT ThIS CALENDAR YEAR?

NO YES HOW MANY DAYS? 9 NO YES TO WHOM?

8. DOES THE APPLICANT HAVE POSSESSION OR WRITtEN PERMISSION FOR THE USE OF THE PREMISES TO BE LICENSED? Yes El No

LIST BELOW THE EXACT DATE(S) FOR WHICH APPLICATION IS BEING MADE FOR PERMIT
Date 12-16-201 1 Date Date Date Date
Hours From 5:00 p rn. Hours From rn. Hours From rn. Hours From rn. Hours From rn.

To 10:00 p.m. To rn. To rn. To rn. To rn.

LOCAL LICENSING AUTHORITY (CITY OR COUNTY)
j crrv TELEPHONE NUMBER OF CITY/COUNTY CLERK

El COUNTY
SIGNATURE TITLE DATE

DO NOT WRITE IN THIS SPACE - FOR DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE USE ONLY

UABIUV( INFORMATION

LIcense Account Number Liability Date State TOTAL

-750 (999) $

DR 8439 (0628V6)
COLORADO DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE
LIQUOR ENFORCEMENT DIVISION
1375 SHERMAN STREET
DENVER CO 80261
(303) 205-2300

APPLICATION FOR A SPECIAL
EVENTS PERMIT

Department Use Only

IN ORDER TO QUAUFY FOR A SPECIAL EVENTS PERMIT, YOU MUST BE NONPROFIT
AND ONE OF THE FOLLOWING (See back for detaIls.)

El SOCIAL El ATHLETIC El PHILANTHROPIC INSTITUTION
FRATERNAL El CHARTERED BRANCH, LODGE OR CHAPTER El POLITICAL CANDIDATE

El PATRIOTIC El OF A NATIONAL ORGANIZATION OR SOCIETY El MUNICIPALITY OWNING ARTS

El POLITICAL El RELIGIOUS INSTITUTION FACILITIES

OATH OF APPLICANT
I declare under penalty of perjury In the second degree that I have read the foregoing application and all attachments thereto, and
that all information therein is true, correct, and complete to the best of my knowledge.

SIGNATURE TITLE DATE

0 Secretary 10-18-2011

REPOR AND M’PROVAL OF LOCAL LICENSING AUTHORITY (CITY OR COUNTY)
The foregoing application has been examined and the premises, business conducted and character of the applicant is satisfactory,
and we do report that such permit, if granted, will comply with the provisions of Title 12, Article 48, C.R.S., as amended.

THEREFORE, THIS APPUCAT1ON IS APPROVED.

(Instructions on Reverse SIze)



Grand River Rospital Distriet

jetin Ro1

vii irv]it



Hver HospRal Disffict
Hospital Services I Farn fly Me Inc Ini Medicine Women s Health I SpeciaUy Services Long Term Care Occupational Health Services

October 18, 201 1

To Whom It May Concern:

Permission is granted for the BPOE Lodge Rifle Elks Lodge #2195 to have a
Special Events Permit for alcoholic beverages during the City of Rifle
Holiday Event to be held on Grand River Hospital District’s premises on
Friday, December 16, 2011.

Please contact me if you have any questions or need further information.

Sincerely,

Grand River Hospital District

GranU River Hospital anti Medical Center 970.625.1510, 501 Airport Road, Rifle I BaLtleiiicflt Mesa Medical Center 970,285.7046, 73 Sipprelle Drive, Suite K, Parachute

Grand River Health aSalety Center 970.285.573), 71 Sipprelle Drive Unit 1, Parachute I E. Gene Moore Care Center 970.625,1514, 701 East 5th Sfreet, Rifle



City of Rifle

Special Events Liquor Permit Application

Name of Applicant / Organization: ,
- ( L 3 C)

Thank you for your interest in a Special Event in the City of Rifle. In addition to the State Application
(Form #DR 8439), the following information must be provided in order for your application to be
considered. Incomplete applications will be rejected. Please do not hesitate to contact the City Clerk with
questions at (970) 665-6405.

1. The City requires that a Special Events Permit application be received no later than 45 days prior
to the event. What is the date(s) of your event? ‘ -/i..

2. What security measures have you taken to ensure your event will be safe for all participants and
control entry of under age persons? j ‘s

3. Per Rifle Municipal Code 6-5-170(a)(3), the City requires that at least one server, manager, or
owner/operator, including volunteers, who has successfully completed an approved educational liquor
serving seminar, is present at all times and is supervising the dispensing of alcoholic beverages. What is
the name of the person(s) who has this certification and will be on the premises the entire time of your
event?

4. Have you included the appropriate fees with your application?

________________

Fees: For Malt, Vinous, and Spirituous Liquor
Check payable to the City ofRifle for $25.00 per day

Fees: For Fermented Malt Beverage (3.2% Beer)
Check payable to the City ofRWe for $10.00 per day

5. Does your diagram of the intended licensed premises include:

_______

Measurements/dimensions of the area to be licensed?

_______

Points of ingress/egress?
An outline in red of the area to be licensed?

6. Please provide a copy of a deed, lease, or written permission of the owner(s) for use of the
premises.

7. I have read the Rifle Municipal Code provisions regarding (copies of these sections are attached to
this form):

______

Section 10.8.50 and Section 10.8.60 (7)No minors allowed on licensed premises

______

Section 10.8.80 Open container law

______

Section 6.5.170 Educational requirements for Licensees

Siature: y---- Date: -/ ))



 

 

 

 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
 
FROM:  Matt Sturgeon, Assistant City Manager 
 
DATE:  October 26, 2011 
 
SUBJECT: Request to Adopt 2009 International Building Codes (Fire Code excluded) 
 
 
The City of Rifle currently requires new construction comply with 2003 International Building 
Codes (IBC).  Staff recommends City Council amend the Municipal Code to require compliance 
with 2009 IBC.  The Fire District requested this amendment exclude the 2009 International Fire 
Code.  The Fire District will bring forth the 2009 IFC in the near future. 
 
If Council chooses to adopt the codes recommended by staff, there are several amendments 
recommended by the Building Inspector that will be discussed during the public hearing.  These 
amendments include: 
 

• Specifying local climatic conditions (wind speed, snow load, frost depth, etc.); 
• Requiring engineered foundations for commercial structures; 
• Requiring geotechnical investigations (soil tests); 
• Specifying penalties for failing to comply with codes; and 
• Removing requirement that one- and two-family dwellings install automatic fire 

systems.   
 
The amendment removing sprinkler requirement is the amendment of greatest significance.  
The Fire District recommends an amendment that requires these systems be required starting 
January 1, 2013.  Staff omitted the requirement entirely with the understanding Council can put 
this requirement back later.   
 
 



 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 12 

SERIES OF 2011 
 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, REPEALING ARTICLE VII OF 
CHAPTER 18 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE, AND REPEALING AND REENACTING 
ARTICLES II, III, IV, V, VI, VIII, X, AND XI  OF CHAPTER 18 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL 
CODE TO ADOPT BY REFERENCE THE 2009 EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE, INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE, INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS 
CODE, INTERNATIONAL PERFORMANCE CODE, INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING 
CODE, INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONVERSATION CODE, AND INTERNATIONAL 
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE AND COMMENTARTIES THERETO AND ADDING 
ENFORCEMENT PROVISIONS TO ARTICLE XII OF CHAPTER 18. 
 

WHEREAS, by Ordinance 8, Series of 2004, the City adopted by reference the 2003 Editions 
of the International Building Code, the International Residential Code, the International Mechanical 
Code, the International Plumbing Code, and the International Fuel Gas Code, as the building codes 
for the City; and 

 
WHEREAS, by Ordinance No. 31, Series of 2006, the City adopted by reference the 2003 

Editions of the International Existing Buildings Code, the International Energy Conservation Code, 
and the International Property Maintenance Code as additional building codes for the City; and 
 

WHEREAS, the International Code Council released updated editions of International 
Building Codes in 2009, and staff recommends adopting the 2009 Editions, with commentary, and 
repealing the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, which has 
been rendered unnecessary by adoption of the International Property Maintenance Code; and 
 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the authority vested in the City Council by Section 4.7 of the Rifle 
City Charter, the City Council desires to amend the Rifle Municipal Code in order to adopt by 
reference the 2009 Editions of the International Building Code, International Residential Code, 
International Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Plumbing Code, 
International Existing Buildings Code, International Energy Conservation Code, International 
Property Maintenance Code, and the International Performance Code, as amended and with 
Commentaries, as the building codes for the City pursuant to the procedures set forth in C.R.S. §31-
16-201, et seq.; and 

 
WHEREAS, the City Council further desires to clarify its building code enforcement 

authority at Article XII of Chapter 18. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, ORDAINS 
THAT: 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 2 of 16 
 

 

Section 1.  The foregoing recitals are incorporated as findings by the City Council. 
 

Section 2.  Article VII of the Rifle Municipal Code, the Uniform Code for the Abatement of 
Dangerous Buildings, 1997 Edition, is hereby repealed in its entirety.   

 
Section 3.  Article II of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 

entirety and reenacted as follows. 
 
 
 

ARTICLE II 
Building Code 

18-2-10. Adoption by reference. 

 Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Building Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary and 
appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, to have the same force and effect as if set forth herein in 
every particular.  The purpose of this code is to establish minimum regulations governing the 
conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures within the City; by providing the 
standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to 
ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of 
buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such structures.   

18-2-20. Copy on file. 

 At least one (1) copy of the International Building Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 
and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be kept on file in 
the office of the City Clerk or Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person 
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays excepted.  Copies of 
said code and appendices shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by 
Section 31-16-206, C.R.S.   

18-2-30. Amendments. 

 The International Building Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 

 (1) At Section 101.1, insert the "City of Rifle." 

 (2) Section 107.3.4.1, "Design professional in responsible charge – General," is amended 
by the addition of a new fourth paragraph, to read as follows: 

 107.3.4.1  General. 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 3 of 16 
 

 

*** 

For all commercial buildings in the City, architectural plans must be stamped by a licensed 
architect and structural plans by a licensed engineer. 

(3) Section 1608.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1608.2  Ground snow loads.  The minimum ground snow load for buildings or structures 
within the City of Rifle shall be forty (40) pounds per square foot ('psf').  Potential 
accumulation of snow at valleys, parapets, roof structures and offsets of roofs in uneven 
configuration shall be considered.  The following criteria for climatic and geographic design 
shall apply, as may be amended by resolution of the City Council: 

TABLE R301.2(1) 
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA 

Ground 
Snow 
Load 

Wind 
Speed 
(mph) 

Seismic 
Design 

Category 

Subject to Damage From 

Winter 
Design 
Temp 

Ice Shield 
Under-
layment 

Required 
Flood 

Hazards 

Air 
Freezing 

Index 

Mean 
Annual 
Temp 

Weather- 
ing 

Frost 
Line 

Depth Termite Decay 

40 psf 90 
mph 

C Severe 36" Slight/mod Slight -2 F Yes Yes/10-
15-85 

2500 48 F 

 
(4) At Section 1612.3, insert the "City of Rifle." 

(5) At Section 1612.3, insert "January 3, 1986." 

(6) Section 1704.1, "Special Inspections, General," is hereby amended by the addition of 
a new last sentence to the first paragraph, to read as follows: 

1704.1  General.   

*** 

The building official shall have the discretion to require special inspections for any 
commercial structure in the City. 

(7) A new Section 1801.3 is hereby adopted, to read as follows: 

1801.3  Commercial foundations.  Engineered foundations shall be required for all 
commercial buildings in the City. 

            (8) Section 1803.2 is hereby deleted and readopted to read as follows. 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 4 of 16 
 

 

1803.2.  Investigations required.  Geotechnical investigations shall be conducted in 
accordance with Sections 1803.3 through 1803.5.  Soils and post-excavation soils tests shall 
be required without exception. 

(9) Section 1805.1.3 is hereby amended by the addition of the following new last 
sentence.  All other text in Section 1805.1.3 shall remain in full force and effect. 

1805.1.3  Ground-water control. 

*** 

Such drainage systems shall be required in all structures unless specifically exempted by the 
building official. 

(10) Section 1805.4.3 is hereby amended to delete the exception to the requirement of an 
approved drainage system. 

(11) Section 2210.3.1 is hereby amended by the addition of the following new last 
sentence.  All other text in Section 2210.30.1 shall remain in full force and effect. 

2210.3.1 Design. 

*** 

The Duration of Load Factor is 1.0. 

(12) Subsection (5) to Section 2303.4.1.1 is hereby amended by the addition of the 
following new last sentence.  All other text in Section 2303.4.1.1 shall remain in full force 
and effect. 

2303.4.1.1  Truss design drawings.  

*** 

5. The Duration of Load Factor is 1.0. 

(13) At Section 3412.2, insert "January 2, 2012."   



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 5 of 16 
 

 

18-2-40. Penalties. 

 Section 113.4 of the adopted code, which contains a penalty clause, is amended to read as 
follows: 

 Section 114.4.  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof, or who erects, constructs, alters or 
repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or 
directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of 
this code, shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof 
during which any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or 
permitted, and upon a conviction of any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be 
punished by a fine of not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or 
both.  Any criminal offense under this section shall be one of strict liability." 

Section 4.  Article III of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 
entirety and reenacted as follows. 

 
ARTICLE III 

Residential Code 
 

18-3-10. Adoption by reference. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Residential Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 
and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor 
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795, to have the same force and effect as if set forth 
herein in every particular.  The purpose and subject matter of this code is to regulate and govern the 
construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal 
and demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings 
(townhouses) not more than three (3) stories in height with separate means of egress in the City. 

 
18-3-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Residential Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 
and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be kept on file in 
the office of the City Clerk or Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person 
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays excepted.  Copies of 
said code and appendices shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by 
Section 31-16-206, C.R.S.   
 
18-3-30. Amendments. 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 6 of 16 
 

 

 
The International Residential Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 
 

(1) At Section R101.1, insert the "City of Rifle." 
 
(2) At Table R301.2(1), use Climatic and Graphic Design Criteria as adopted in 

International Building Code, 2009 Edition.  
 

(3) Section R311.7.4.1, "Stair treads and risers   Riser height," is hereby repealed in its 
entirety and reenacted to read as follows: 

 
R311.7.4.1  Riser height.  The maximum riser height shall be 8 inches.  The riser shall be 
measured vertically between the leading edges of the adjacent treads.  The greatest riser 
height within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than ⅜ inch (9.5 mm). 
 
(4) Section R313.2 is hereby amended to read as follows. 
 
R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems.  Automatic residential fire 
sprinkler systems shall not be required.  When an automatic fire sprinkler system is not 
installed in a two-family dwelling, a two-hour separation between units is required. 
 
(5) Section R401.4 is hereby amended to read as follows. 
 
R401.4  Soil tests.  Soil tests and post-excavation soil reports done by an approved agency 
using an approved method shall be required and reviewed by the building official. 
 
(6) Section R802.10.2 is hereby amended by the addition of the following last sentence.   
 
R802.10.2  Design. 
 
*** 
Duration of Load Factor is 1.0. 

 
(7) At Section P2603.6.1, insert "forty-two inches (42")" in both brackets. 

 
(8) At Section P3103.1, insert "twelve inches (12")" in both brackets. 
 

18-3-40. Penalties. 
 

Section R113.4 of the adopted code, which contains a penalty clause, is amended to read as 
follows: 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 7 of 16 
 

 

Section R113.4.  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof, or who erects, constructs, alters or 
repairs a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or 
directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of 
this code, shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof 
during which any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or 
permitted, and upon a conviction of any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be 
punished by a fine of not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or 
both.  Any criminal offense under this section shall be one of strict liability. 
 
Section 5.  Article IV of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 

reenacted as follows: 
 

ARTICLE IV 
Mechanical Code 

 
18-4-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Mechanical Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 
and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor 
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795.  The purpose of this code is to regulate and control 
the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, 
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of mechanical systems in the City 
 
18-4-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Mechanical Code, 2009 edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be 
kept on file in the office of the City Clerk or Building Official and may be inspected by any 
interested person between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays 
excepted.  Copies of said code and appendices shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate 
price, as required by Section 31-16-206, C.R.S.   

 
18-4-30. Amendments. 
 

The International Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 
 
(1) At Section 101.1, insert the "City of Rifle." 

 
(2) At Section 106.5.2, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 

 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 8 of 16 
 

 

(3) At Section 106.5.3, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 

(4) Section 108.5 is amended so that the last sentence reads as follows: 
 

Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as prescribed in Section 108.4 of this code. 
 

18-4-40. Penalties. 
 

Section 108.4 of the adopted code, which contains a penalty clause, is amended to read as 
follows: 
 

Section 108.4.  Violation penalties.  Any person, who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or 
repairs mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of 
the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, 
shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which 
any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or permitted, and upon a 
conviction of any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be punished by a fine of 
not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or both.  Any criminal 
offense under this section shall be one of strict liability. 
 
Section 6.  Article V of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 

reenacted as follows: 
 

ARTICLE V 
Plumbing Code 

 
18-5-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Plumbing Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary and 
appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this code is to regulate 
and control the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, 
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing systems in the City. 

 
18-5-20. Copy on file. 

 
At least one (1) copy of the International Plumbing Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 

appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be kept on file in the 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 9 of 16 
 

 

office of the City Clerk or Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person between 
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays excepted.  Copies of said 
code and appendices shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by 
Section 31-16-206, C.R.S. 

 
18-5-30. Amendments. 
 

The International Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 
 
(1) At Section 101.1, insert the "City of Rifle." 
 
(2) At Section 106.6.2, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 
(3) At Section 106.6.3, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 
(4) Section 108.5 is amended so that the last sentence reads as follows: 
 
Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after having been served 
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a 
violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as prescribed in Section 108.4 of this 
code. 
 
(5) At Section 305.6.1, insert "thirty inches (30")" in both brackets. 
 
(6) At Section 904.1, insert "twelve inches (12")" in both brackets 

 
18-5-40. Penalties. 
 

Section 108.4 of the adopted code, which contains a penalty clause, is amended and set forth 
in full below, as follows: 

 
Section 108.4.  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails 
to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs 
plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 
building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be 
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which any 
violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or permitted, and upon a 
conviction of any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be punished by a fine of 
not more than $1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or both.  Any criminal 
offense under this section shall be one of strict liability. 
 
Section 7.  Article VI of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed and 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 10 of 16 
 

 

reenacted as follows: 
 

ARTICLE VI 
Fuel Gas Code 

 
18-6-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary and 
appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, 
Country Club Hills, Illinois, 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this code is to establish 
the minimum regulations governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and 
structures by providing the standards for supplied utilities and the design and installation of gas 
systems and gas-fired appliances in the City.   
 
18-6-20. Copy on file. 

 
At least one (1) copy of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2009 edition, and the commentary 

and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be kept on file in 
the office of the City Clerk or Building Official and may be inspected by any interested person 
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holidays excepted.  Copies of 
said code and appendices shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by 
Section 31-16-206, C.R.S.   
 
18-6-30. Amendments. 
 

The code adopted herein is amended as follows: 
 
(1) At Section 101.1, insert the "City of Rifle." 
 
(2) At Section 106.6.2, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 
(3) At Section 106.6.3, insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 
(4) Section 108.5 is amended so that the last sentence reads as follows: 
 
Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as prescribed in Section 108.4 of this code. 
 

18-6-40. Penalties. 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 11 of 16 
 

 

Section 108.4 of the adopted code, which contains a penalty clause, is amended to read as 
follows: 

 
Section 108.4.  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or 
repairs work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the building 
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty 
of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of 
any provision of this code is committed, continued or permitted, and upon a conviction of 
any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be punished by a fine of not more than 
$1,000 or by imprisonment for not more than 90 days, or both.  Any criminal offense under 
this section shall be one of strict liability. 
 
Section 8. A new Article VII of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby 

enacted to read as follows. 
 

ARTICLE VII 
Performance Code 

 
18-7-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Performance Code, 2009 Edition, and the commentary 
and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor 
Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this code is to 
regulate and govern the performance-based design, construction, quality of materials, erection, 
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of 
building and/or fire protection systems in the City.   

 
18-7-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Performance Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be 
kept on file in the office of the City Clerk or Building Official.  Copies of the code and appendices 
shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by Section 31-16-206, C.R.S. 
 

Section 9. Article VIII of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed in 
its entirety and reenacted as follows: 

 
ARTICLE VIII 

Existing Building Code 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 12 of 16 
 

 

18-8-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West 
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this 
code is to regulate and govern the repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition and relocation of 
existing buildings, including historic buildings in the City.   

 
18-8-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be 
kept on file in the office of the City Clerk or Building Official.  Copies of the code and appendices 
shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by Section 31-16-206, C.R.S. 

 
18-8-30. Amendments. 
 

The International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 
 
(1) Section 101.1:  insert "City of Rifle."   
 
(2) Section 1301.2:  insert "April 1965."   
 
(3) Section 114.3 is amended so that the last sentence reads as follows: 
 
Any person who shall continue any work on the system after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or 
unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as prescribed in Section 113.4 of this code. 
 

18-8-40. Penalties. 
 
Section 113.4 of the International Existing Building Code, 2009 Edition, which contains a 

penalty clause, is amended to read as follows: 
 
Section 113.4  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who repairs, alters or changes the 
occupancy of a building or structure in violation of the approved construction documents or 
directive of the building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of 
this code, shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof 
during which any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or 
permitted and, upon a conviction of any violation, such person, firm or corporation shall be 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 13 of 16 
 

 

punished by a fine of not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000.00) or by imprisonment for 
not more than ninety (90) days, or both.  Any criminal offense under this section shall be one 
of strict liability. 
 
Section 10. Article X of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 

entirety and reenacted as follows: 
  

ARTICLE X 
Energy Conservation Code 

 
18-10-10. Adoption. 
 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West 
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this 
code is to regulate and govern energy-efficient building envelopes and installation of energy-efficient 
mechanical, lighting and power systems and provide for the issuance of permits and payment of fees 
therefor.   

 
18-10-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be 
kept on file in the office of the City Clerk or Building Official.  Copies of the code and appendices 
shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by Section 31-16-206, C.R.S. 
  
 
18-10-30. Amendments. 
 

The International Energy Conservation Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows:   
 
(1) Section 101.1:  insert "City of Rifle." 

 
Section 11. Article XI of Chapter 16 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its 

entirety and reenacted as follows. 
 

ARTICLE XI 
Property Maintenance Code 

 
18-11-10. Adoption. 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 14 of 16 
 

 

Pursuant to the power and authority conferred by Section 31-16-201 et seq., C.R.S., there is 
adopted by reference thereto the International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, promulgated by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West 
Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, Illinois 60478-5795.  The purpose and subject matter of this 
code is to regulate and govern the conditions of all property, buildings and structures by providing 
standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to 
ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; the condemnation of buildings 
and structures unfit for human occupancy and use; and the demolition of existing structures; and by 
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor.   

 
18-11-20. Copy on file. 
 

At least one (1) copy of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, and the 
commentary and appendices thereto, together with the ordinances codified in this Chapter, shall be 
kept on file in the office of the City Clerk or Building Official.  Copies of the code and appendices 
shall be available for sale to the public at a moderate price, as required by Section 31-16-206, C.R.S. 
  
18-11-30. Amendments. 
 

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, is amended as follows: 
 

(1) Section 101.1:  insert "City of Rifle."   
 

(2) Section 103.5:  insert "as established by the City of Rifle." 
 
(3) Section 302.4 insert eight inches (8”) as maximum weed height. 

 
(4) Section 304.14:  insert "March 1 through November 1." 

 
(5) Section 602.3:  insert "September 1 through June 1." 

 
(6) Section 602.4:  insert "September 1 through June 1."   
 

18-11-40. Penalties. 
 

Section 106.4 of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, which contains 
a penalty clause, is amended to read as follows: 

 
Section 106.4  Violation penalties.  Any person who violates a provision of this code or 
fails to comply therewith or with any of the requirements thereof shall be guilty of a separate 
offense for each and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any provision 
of this code is committed, continued or permitted and, upon a conviction of any violation, 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 15 of 16 
 

 

such person, firm or corporation shall be punished by a fine of not more than one thousand 
dollars ($1,000.00) or by imprisonment for not more than ninety (90) days, or both.  Any 
criminal offense under this section shall be one of strict liability." 
 
Section 12. Article XII of Rifle Municipal Code Chapter 18 is hereby amended by the 

addition of Section 18-12-70 to read as follows: 
 
18-12-70 Attorney Fees.   
 
In addition to any other fees and charges as may be assessed by the City for violations of this 

Chapter, the City shall be entitled to collection of its reasonable attorney fees and costs relating to or 
arising from any enforcement action undertaken by the City pursuant to this Article. 

 
Section 13. Article XII of Rifle Municipal Code Chapter 18 is hereby amended by the 

addition of Section 18-12-80 to read as follows: 
 
18-12-80. Collections; Liens. 

(a) In the event of failure to pay all penalties, fees and costs assessed for violations of this 
Chapter, the City may refer the matter for collection by whatever means are available to the City.  

(b) In the event of failure to pay all penalties, fees and costs assessed for violations of this 
Chapter, the City Manager shall record a notice of lien with the County Clerk and Recorder as a lien 
against the property in violation for the amounts due. The assessment shall be a lien against the 
property until it is paid and shall have priority over all other liens except general taxes and prior 
special assessments.  The City shall have all remedies for collection thereof provided by state 
statutes, for the purpose of having the assessment placed upon the tax list and collected in the same 
manner as taxes are now collected.  The amount of such assessment may be paid to the City Clerk at 
any time before the tax list is placed in the hands of the County Treasurer, but thereafter only to the 
County Treasurer. In case the responsible party shall fail to pay such assessment within the required 
time as provided above, then it shall be the duty of the City Clerk to certify the amount of the 
assessment as provided for by state law for the collection of delinquent general taxes.  

(c)  An action or other process provided by law may be maintained by the City to recover 
or collect any amounts, including late fees, interest and costs, owing under this Chapter. 

 
Section 14.   This ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and 

matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect as of January 
1, 2012. 
 
 
 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 12, Series of 2011 
Page 16 of 16 
 

 

INTRODUCED on October 5, 2011, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered 
published as required by the Charter. 

 
INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the City of Rifle, 

Colorado, held on November 2, 2011 at a public hearing, passed with amendments, approved and 
ordered published in full as required by Charter. 
 

Dated this _____ day of _________________, 2011. 
 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
 
 
By: ____________________________________ 

Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_______________________________ 
City Clerk 



 

 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 16 

SERIES OF 2011 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO, AMENDING 
SECTION 6-5-100 OF THE RIFLE MUNICIPAL CODE REGARDING 
ENFORCEMENT OPTIONS FOR VIOLATIONS OF LIQUOR LICENSES 
AND STATE AND LOCAL LIQUOR LAWS.  

 
WHEREAS, Chapter 6, Article V of the Rifle Municipal Code (“RMC”) regulates the 

licensing of establishments that sell liquor and the method for enforcement when the terms of a 
liquor license and/or state or local liquor laws are violated; and 

 
WHEREAS, the current code provisions in Section 100, Chapter 6, Article V only 

provide for suspension or revocation of a license in the event of a violation; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Colorado Liquor Code allows a local liquor licensing authority to 

receive the payment of a fine for a violation as opposed to suspension of a license (C.R.S. ' 12-
47-601 (3)); and 

 
WHEREAS, staff recommends amending RMC Section 6-5-100 to allow for the payment 

of a fine in certain circumstances to remedy a violation of a liquor license and/or state or local 
liquor laws in order to provide additional options to encourage compliance with such licenses 
and laws; and 

 
WHEREAS, the Rifle City Council finds and determines that RMC Section 6-5-100 

should be amended accordingly. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 

OF RIFLE, COLORADO, THAT: 
 

Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as if set forth in full. 
 
Section 2. Section 6-5-100 of the Rifle Municipal Code is hereby amended to read as 

follows, with additions shown in bold, double-underlined text and deletions in strike through 
text. 

 
Sec. 6-5-100. Suspension and revocation of licenses; imposition of fines; hearings.  

(a) Proceedings for suspension or revocation of a liquor license shall be commenced in either of the 
following manners: (1) upon the filing of a complaint with the Liquor Licensing Authority by a third 
party which is supported by probable cause; or (2) upon the request of the Chief of Police or City Clerk 
based on a determination that there is probable cause to believe a violation has occurred or is occurring 
after a full investigation. The Liquor Licensing Authority shall set a time and place for a hearing on the 
matter, and the City Clerk shall give the licensee timely written notice of the date, time and place of the 
hearing. The notice shall describe generally the alleged violations and the grounds showing probable 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 
Page 3 of 3 
 
 

 

cause for suspension or revocation of a license. The notice shall be served on the licensee by certified 
mail to the last address furnished to the City at least forty-eight (48) hours prior to the hearing.  

(b) The Liquor Licensing Authority or a hearing officer appointed by the Liquor Licensing Authority 
shall conduct the hearing. The hearing officer may be a designated City Council member or Municipal 
Judge.  

(c) The City Clerk and the hearing officer shall have the power to administer oaths, issue subpoenas 
and, when necessary, grant continuances.  

(d) In all such hearings, the City Attorney shall act on behalf of and advise the City Council. The 
Liquor Licensing Authority shall appoint special counsel to conduct an investigation and prosecute the 
licensee on behalf of the City.  

(e) All hearings before the Liquor Licensing Authority or the hearing officer shall be conducted in 
accordance with the procedures set forth in Chapter 1, Article VII of this Code.  

(f) If the Liquor Licensing Authority conducts a hearing, it shall render a decision in accordance with 
Section 1-7-60 of this Code. If the hearing is held before a hearing officer, the hearing officer shall make 
a recommendation in writing to the Liquor Licensing Authority within thirty (30) days after the close of 
the hearing. The written recommendation shall contain findings of fact and conclusions of law based on 
the evidence presented at the hearing. A copy of this summary and recommendation shall be transmitted 
to the licensee. At the next regular Council meeting following the submission of the hearing officer's 
recommendation, the Liquor Licensing Authority shall consider the same. In its discretion, the Liquor 
Licensing Authority may reject the hearing officer's recommendation, refer the matter back for further 
proceedings, adopt the recommendation or order a new hearing, either before the original hearing officer 
or before the entire Liquor Licensing Authority or a committee or member thereof. 

(g) The Liquor Licensing Authority may suspend any license for a period up to six (6) months, or 
revoke a license permanently, based on evidence of good cause therefor presented at the hearing.  

(h) In the event of revocation, suspension or cessation of business, no portion of the license fee or 
occupation tax shall be refunded.  

     (i) Whenever a decision of the Liquor Licensing Authority suspending a license or permit for 
fourteen days or less becomes final, whether by failure of the licensee to appeal the decision, 
stipulation between the City and the licensee that such decision is final, or by exhaustion of all 
appeals and judicial review, the licensee may, before the operative date of the suspension, petition 
for permission to pay a fine in lieu of having the license or permit suspended for all or part of the 
suspension period.  Upon receipt of the petition, the Liquor Licensing Authority may, in its sole 
discretion, stay the proposed suspension and cause any investigation to be made which it deems 
desirable and may, in its sole discretion, grant the petition if it is satisfied: 
 

1. That the public welfare and morals will not be impaired by permitting the licensee to 
operate during the period set for suspension and that the payment of the fine will 
achieve the desired disciplinary purpose; and 

2. That the books and records of the licensee are kept in such a manner that the loss of 



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 
Page 3 of 3 
 
 

 

sales of alcohol beverages that the licensee would have suffered had the suspension gone 
into effect can be determined with reasonable accuracy therefrom; and 

3. That the licensee has not had his or her license or permit suspended or revoked by the 
Liquor Licensing Authority, nor had any suspension stayed by payment of a fine to the 
Liquor Licensing Authority, during the two years immediately preceding the date of the 
complaint or request as described in paragraph (a) which has resulted in a final decision 
to suspend the license or permit. 

4. The fine imposed shall be equivalent to twenty percent of the licensee’s estimated gross 
revenues from sales of alcohol beverages during the period of the proposed suspension; 
but that said fine shall not be less than two hundred dollars nor greater than five 
thousand dollars. 

5. The Liquor Licensing Authority may grant such stays of the proceedings as are 
necessary for it to complete its investigation and make findings as required herein. 

 
     (j)  The Liquor Licensing Authority may, in its sole discretion, enter into a stipulation and order 
with a licensee imposing a fine in lieu of suspension of a license contemporaneous with entering into 
a stipulation and order with a licensee containing such findings as are required in paragraph (f). 
 
     (k)  Payment of any fine accepted in lieu of having a license or permit suspended shall be in the 
form of cash, certified check or cashier’s check.  Said funds shall be deposited into the general fund 
of the City of Rifle.  Upon receipt of the fine, the Liquor Licensing Authority shall enter an order 
permanently staying the imposition of the suspension.  If the Liquor Licensing Authority does not 
make the findings required under paragraph (i) and does not order the suspension permanently 
stayed, the suspension shall go into effect on the date finally set by the Liquor Licensing Authority. 
 
    (l)  The licensee shall have the right to appeal or seek judicial review of a decision of the Liquor 
Licensing Authority as provided in Section 1-7-70 of this Code. 

 
INTRODUCED on November 2, 2011, read by title, passed on first reading, and ordered 

published by title as required by the Charter. 
 
INTRODUCED a second time at a regular meeting of the Council of the City of Rifle, 

Colorado, held on November 16, 2011, passed without amendment, approved, and ordered 
published in full as required by the Charter. 
 

Dated this ___ day of __________________, 2011. 
 

CITY OF RIFLE, COLORADO 
 
 

BY  ___________________________________ 
 Mayor 

  



City of Rifle, Colorado 
Ordinance No. 16, Series of 2011 
Page 3 of 3 
 
 

 

 
ATTEST:  
 
 
_______________________________ 
City Clerk 



 

 
 

 
 
Sander N. Karp 
James S. Neu 
Karl J. Hanlon 
Michael J. Sawyer 
James F. Fosnaught 

Greg S. Russi, 

Of Counsel 

 

 
 

 
 
Anna S. Itenberg 
Cassia R. Furman 
T. Damien Zumbrennen 
Jeffrey J. Conklin 
 

 
201 14

th
 Street, Suite 200 

P. O. Drawer  2030 
Glenwood Springs, CO 81602 
Telephone: (970) 945-2261 
Facsimile: (970) 945-7336 
www.mountainlawfirm.com 
 

Michael J. Sawyer 
mjs@mountainlawfirm.com 

 

October 26, 2011   
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 
TO:  MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL, CITY OF RIFLE 
 
FROM:  KARP NEU HANLON, P.C. 
 
RE:  CONTRACT FOR 200 ACRE FEET OF WATER IN RUEDI RESERVOIR 
 
 

 
 In 2010, the City of Rifle applied for a contract with the Bureau of Reclamation (“Bureau”) for an 
additional 200 acre-feet

1
 of water stored in Ruedi Reservoir.  In order to issue the contract, the Bureau 

conducted an environmental assessment.  The environmental assessment was completed in September and 
a Finding of No Significant Impact was signed by the Bureau.  This paves the way for the City to enter 
into a contract for Ruedi Reservoir water with the Bureau.  A form contract was provided by the Bureau 
which is enclosed in your packet. 
 

Background 
 
 The City of Rifle owns several water rights which provide the physical supply for the municipal 
water system.  The City’s primary water intake is at the Colorado River Intake.  Some of the water rights 
decreed to divert at this location are junior in nature (many water rights on the Colorado River date back 
to the 1800s).  As such, at times the City’s water rights cannot divert in priority – particularly so during 
drought years).  As a result, the City needs an “augmentation” supply that can be released into the 
Colorado River in the event of a “call” to make up for the City’s junior municipal uses.  The Ruedi 
Reservoir water provides this augmentation supply. 
 
 The City of Rifle already has a contract with the Bureau for 350 acre-feet water in Ruedi 
Reservoir dating back to the 1990s.  Each year, the City pays the Bureau $18,000 for this existing 
contract.  These payments are primarily reimbursement to the Bureau of the capital costs of Ruedi 
Reservoir (construction costs and accumulated interest).  A small portion goes to fund operation and 
maintenance of the Reservoir.  Pursuant to an analysis by Resource Engineering the City’s existing water 
rights and contract with the Bureau will provide a stable municipal water supply to serve up to 24,000 
residents.   
 
 The Resource Engineering report concluded that the acquisition of an additional 150 acre-feet of 
Ruedi Reservoir water would provide a stable municipal water supply for between 26,000 and 26,900 
residents.  Because the cost of acquiring water in Ruedi Reservoir increases with each passing year 
(accumulated interest is added to the capital cost reimbursement charge), the decision was made in 2009 
to acquire an additional 200 acre-feet contract.  That contract is now ready for approval and execution by 

                                                 
1  An acre-foot is the amount of water to cover 1 acre with water 1 foot deep. 



KARP NEU HANLON, P.C. 

 

Page 2 

 
the City. 
 

Contract Terms 
 
 The form of contract is standard to all parties contracting with the Bureau.  The term of the 
contact is 25 years.  During the first 9 years, the City is required to pay the capital cost reimbursement to 
the Bureau in the amount of $32,410 per year.  Once the capital cost is paid, the City will only be 
responsible to pay annual operation and maintenance charges – which historically have been around 
$1000 per year for 200 acre-feet.  Further, the City has the right to renew the contract after the initial 25 
year term (upon generally applicable terms imposed by the Bureau).  However, once the capital cost 
reimbursement has been paid, capital costs will not be required under a renewal of the contract. 
 
 While the capital cost reimbursement may seem high, it is not bad in light of what it costs to 
construct a water storage project.  The capital cost reimbursement works out to $1,297 per acre-foot.  This 
is about what the cost of adjudicated historic consumptive use credits is on the Colorado River.  If the 
City were to construct its own water storage project, the costs could easily exceed $2,000 per acre-foot.  
Payment of the capital cost reimbursement is the necessary price of having a fail-safe water storage 
supply to meet the needs of residents in the future. 















































 

 

RIFLE POLICE DEPARTMENT 
201 East 18th Street • Rifle, CO 81650-3237  

Office: (970) 665-6500 • Fax: (970) 665-6522 • www.rifleco.org  
 

                             MEMORANDUM 
 
 
 TO:  HONORABLE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 

FROM:  DARYL L. MEISNER, CHIEF OF POLICE 
 DATE:  OCTOBER 24, 2011 
 RE:   THIRD QUARTER 2011 REPORT 
 

 

The third quarter has been very busy for the Police Department. 

In August we held the third annual Rifle’s Night Out, in conjunction with National Night Out.  This 
year’s event was well attended by approximately 200 participants.  We collected a sizeable donation 
of canned goods for Lift Up at the “Dunk a Cop”.  The dive-in movie was again very popular.  
Special thanks to the pool staff for their support during this event.   

In September long-time Records Technician Gayla Berry left her position for a job closer to her 
family.  We were fortunate to be able to recruit Aimee Wride, a former Rifle Police Officer, to fill in 
as a temporary employee while we take the time to thoroughly seek the most qualified replacement.  
This arrangement has been very positive for the Police Department, the public has not seen any 
decrease in service, and the Police staff has benefitted from Aimee’s experience.  We are 
progressing toward a permanent replacement and expect to have the position filled in the next few 
weeks. 

Below is a summary of activity by the Police Department from January 1 to September 30, 2011.  
You will notice that there is an increase of about 2.7% in overall calls for service, about 10% 
increase in criminal reports, and 28% increase in adult arrests.  Juvenile contacts are less than the 
same period last year.   

Reorganization has taken place that we hope will improve overall performance.  The Community 
Service Officer has been fully assigned to the supervision of Patrol Sergeants, with greater emphasis 
on animal control and parking enforcement.  

Many of the ancillary duties that the Patrol Sergeants had assumed by default were shifted to the 
Administrative Sergeant.  This permits the Patrol Sergeants more time for direct supervision and 
oversight. 



 

 

RIFLE POLICE DEPARTMENT 
201 East 18th Street • Rifle, CO 81650-3237  

Office: (970) 665-6500 • Fax: (970) 665-6522 • www.rifleco.org  
 

We have made some minor operational adjustments that have streamlined our work process and have 
reduced the processing time for reports/records and transmitting them to the appropriate prosecuting 
attorney.   This is proving to be efficient and effective.  

Activity Summary comparison January through September 2011: 

 

 

 2010  2011 

INCIDENTS (CALLS FOR SERVICE) TOTALS: 11154  11459 
    
CRIMINAL REPORTS: 746  821 

OPEN:  151  177 
CLOSED:  595  644 
    

ARRESTS – TOTAL    
1. ADULTS: 354  455 

1.1.  Taken into custody 286  342 
1.2.  Summons and released 68  108 
1.3.  Other 0  5 

    
2. JUVENILES: 81  63 

2.1. Taken into custody 38  31 
2.2.  Summons and released 43  32 

    
3. IMPAIRED DRIVERS (DUI, DWAI, Drugs) 41  43 
    
 TOTAL TICKETS ISSUED BY TYPE                                                    Total Tickets: 2519  2394 

1. Juvenile Notice to Appear: 8  7 
2. Municipal: 881  902 
3. County: 288  365 
4. (Simple) Parking: 279  224 
5. Warnings - all offenses: 1068  896 

    
    
TRAFFIC ACCIDENTS 194  191 

1. State Reportable (>$1000;  or Injury involved) 95  96 
2. Non-state reportable (private property; or < $1000) 99  95 

    



 

 

RIFLE POLICE DEPARTMENT 
201 East 18th Street • Rifle, CO 81650-3237  

Office: (970) 665-6500 • Fax: (970) 665-6522 • www.rifleco.org  
 

 

 

School activity: 

 

 



 

 

RIFLE POLICE DEPARTMENT 
201 East 18th Street • Rifle, CO 81650-3237  

Office: (970) 665-6500 • Fax: (970) 665-6522 • www.rifleco.org  
 

 

 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 1 of 7 

 
 

UTILITIES / PUBLIC WORKS / ENGINEERING  
 

PROJECT STATUS REPORT  
11/02/11 

  
Bold Text = New Information 

 
Capital Improvement Projects 

 
Water Treatment Plant Design 
 

The Basis of Design Report (BODR) and Environmental Report have 
been submitted to CDPHE for review prior to submitting the application 
for SRF funding.  We are proceeding with final design of the treatment 
plant as outlined in the BODR.  If changes are to be made to reduce the 
capacity, additional engineering costs may be necessary. 
 
The Membrane Process Equipment System was awarded to General Electric 
(Zenon Environmental Corporation) which included shop drawings of the 
membrane system, a demonstration pilot test, and purchase of the units.  A 
decision to purchase the membranes must be made prior to March 2012. 

 
Mitigation for wetlands within the construction site and meeting Corps 
requirements will require a payment to the Spring Water Ranch Wetland 
Mitigation Bank or mitigation restoration measures constructed on site.  The 
bond amount will include this cost.   
 
CDOT has issued an access permit for an entrance to the plant site from U.S. 
6.  A first set of drawings has been prepared for the entrance.  A grading plan 
for the plant site has been prepared.  
 
A final draft of the raw water pipeline alignment was reviewed by Staff and 
sent to CDOT, who issued a permit for construction.  However, they have told 
us that they will not authorize construction of a bore under US 6 and now 
want us to change the drawings to allow trenching within the pavement 
section.  This will require a revision to the agreement with the consultant to 
revise the drawings to meet CDOT requirements but will save many dollars in 
construction costs, now that we can trench in US 6.  The consultant has 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 2 of 7 

prepared a proposal for redesign of the pipeline on the new alignment 
and the additional cost will be presented in the near future.  

 
A control scheme for the new facility has been developed by our consultant 
and reviewed by staff and returned for correction. 

 
A site plan and electric/heating demands have been sent to Xcel for their 
planning and to determine a cost for the service.  Xcel has preliminarily said 
the cost for the electrical service should be very minimal (like zero).  A 
new gas line from 7th Street to the new plant may be in the range of $50 
to $80 thousand. 

  
Asbestos Removal at GMWTP 
 

Walsh Environmental has completed a report determining the amount of and 
cost to remove asbestos and other hazardous material from the existing 
GMWTP.  We have reviewed the report and will recommend funds be set 
aside to perform the work in the future. 

 
Bypass Pipeline at Rifle Pond 
 

This project, funded partially by a STAG Grant, consists of a bypass pipeline 
from the River Intake to the raw water pump station and a bore  across U.S. 6 
for a future raw water pipeline to the new Water Treatment facility.  A permit 
from CDOT was received and forwarded to the contractor for compliance to 
their provisions.  However, as discussed above, CDOT will not allow 
construction of the bore and now wants the pipeline installed by trenching in 
the pavement section of US 6.   This will require redesign and the bore under 
US 6 has been eliminated from the Contractor’s scope of work.  
 
Water in the pond was lowered to allow grading of the bottom to proceed but 
when the river level rose, work was stopped and the pond refilled.  Pipe has 
been fused together and concrete anchors attached for placement across the 
pond.  The contractor has installed the connection to the inlet manhole 
at the pond intake.   
 

Deerfield Park  
 
A cost for Phase 1 construction has been developed and final design 
plans/specifications are being prepared for review.  Staff has reviewed the 
90% drawings and a meeting was held to discuss our comments.  

 
Rifle Arterial Transportation Engineering (S.H. 13 & U.S. 6) 
 

Plans (Phase 1) are being finalized which includes changes to S.H. 13 south 
of Centennial Parkway, reducing two lanes to one to allow Whiteriver traffic to 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 3 of 7 

merge with Railroad Avenue traffic safely before the bridge over the river.  
CDOT has reviewed and approved the preliminary design for the 
improvements and a final office review with CDOT has been held.   
Comments from this meeting have been incorporated into the drawings.  An 
Access Permit has been received from CDOT to construct the improvements 
and work will begin next spring.   Funds have been included in the budget 
to perform this work.  Striping for an eastbound left turn from US 6 at 
West Avenue is included in the project. 
 

Biosolids Removal at the North Wastewater Plant 
 

Sludge has been removed from the lagoons and delivered to Cacaloco for 
composting.  CDPHE has been requested to approve the closure of the 
NWWTP.  

 
Water Sales Building 
 

The project has been put on hold because software is unavailable to mesh 
with the Finance Department software.  The project has been included in 
next year’s budget. 
 

Rifle Creek Plaza Improvements 
 

A contract was awarded to Johnson Construction to complete the remaining 
work (final grading, sleeves for irrigation and electrical use, paving, electrical, 
lighting, curbs, gutters handicap ramps).  Underground conduit and sleeves 
have been installed.  Forming and pouring of curbs and gutters and work 
along West Avenue is nearing completion.  Paving and striping of the 
parking area is complete as well as perimeter sidewalks.  Installation of 
pavers continues.  The detention pond work and drainage within CDOT 
R/W is underway. 

  
Theater Plaza and Landscaping 
 

The work consists of construction of the plaza immediately in front of the 
theater which includes pavers, stamped concrete, landscaping, irrigation and 
lighting.  Also included is landscaping and irrigation throughout the site.  
Landscaping will not be planted until the spring of 2012.  The contractor has 
installed several of the architectural features within the plaza.  Paver 
installation continues. 

 
Expansion of O&M Service Center 
 

The expansion consists of a 30 foot wide by 78 foot long bay on the east side 
of the building with garage doors at each end.  The contract is now complete 
except for punch list items. 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 4 of 7 

 
 
Energy Process Audit 
 

The purpose of this work was to investigate the operations and process 
equipment of the Rifle Regional Wastewater Reclamation Facility to 
determine if savings in energy cost can be realized.  The Final Report to 
establish a baseline of energy use at the Facility determined several 
conservation opportunities.  Staff will determine which recommendation will 
be tried first.  A request for rebate has been sent to Xcel. 
  

Banner Pole Replacement/Addition 
 

Staff and DDA have reviewed several types of poles, bases and fittings to be 
placed on either side of Railroad Avenue and 3rd Street at about four 
locations.    Providing electricity, for Christmas lights, is now included in the 
design.  Locations for the poles have been determined.  A foundation design 
has been detailed and Staff has determined a cost estimate.  Staff should be 
installing these poles next week.   

 
Boat Ramp 
 

CDOT has supplied a lease agreement for the boat ramp area for our review.  
A preliminary layout of the access, parking, ramp and picnic areas has been 
completed.  A wetlands delineation report and a cultural evaluation have been 
finalized.  These reports have been delivered to CDOT.  A nationwide general 
permit from the Corps is necessary.  An engineer has been selected and 
design work is underway. 
 

2011 Street Improvements 
  

Work is complete on 7th Street except for minor repairs.  The drainage outlet 
in front of the Catholic Church has been completed.  Patching was not 
required on 7th Street and we will those funds for repair of 3rd Street at the 
east end of the bridge over Rifle Creek. 

 
Aspen Avenue milling, reshaping and paving is now complete.  Work on 8th 
Street has been completed except for a few minor items.  Whiteriver 
Avenue repair work should begin next week. 
 

Acacia Avenue Water Main Extension 
 

Our consultants have completed the survey and are preparing designs for a 
water main extending from the south end of Acacia avenue to Whiteriver 
Avenue along the existing trail.  This will provide a loop to guarantee water 
service to residents of Deerfield and Rimrock subdivisions during periods 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 5 of 7 

when the 3 mg tank is off the system.  Design is complete.  Presently, this 
work not scheduled for next year but we hope to include this important 
extension in the future.   
 

Cleaning and Televising Sewer Mains 
 

The contractor has cleaned and televised the system under this contract 
(about 30% of the entire City).  We hope to schedule remaining work in 
the future.   
 

Irrigation System Audits 
 

Audits would be free to the homeowners (contractor would be paid from a 
grant to the City).  Recommended improvements by the contractor, if 
requested by the homeowners are to be paid by the homeowner.   A rebate of 
$100, $200 or $300 depending upon the required improvement would be 
deducted from the homeowners cost and paid to the contractor.  Work on the 
majority of the irrigation systems has been completed.  Several audits 
will be performed in the Spring.  

 
U.S. 6 Culvert 
 

CDOT has replaced a 36 inch CMP culvert under U.S. at mile post 93.3 (near 
the proposed water treatment facility) with a 60x36 inch RCP.  The work 
within the pavement area is complete.  Work continues on the inlet 
structure just north of the roadway.   
 

Northeast Pump Station 
 

An additional pump and motor/switchgear is to be installed to meet demand 
from the Northeast Pressure Zone.  An electrical design has been prepared.  
Equipment has been ordered and installation should begin in December 
or January. 
 

3 Mg Tank Mixing Device 
 

A mixing device, similar to those installed in the Airport and West tanks is to 
be installed in the 3 mg tank to prevent chlorine degradation.  Installation 
should occur this year. 

 
Design of West 2nd Street and West Avenue 
 

RFP’s were sent to local engineering firms for a technical and cost proposal 
for improvements to West 2nd Street between West Avenue and Railroad 
Avenue and West Avenue from US 6 to West 2nd Street.  Design would 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 6 of 7 

include, in addition to normal street sections, landscape, street lighting and 
streetscape.  This improvement would provide an attractive and inviting 
entrance to Rifle Creek Plaza from Railroad Avenue and would join the Plaza, 
City Hall and Library complex with the theater site.   No proposals were 
received and Staff has sent the RFP to a landscape architect (who worked on 
the Roundabouts and the theater) for a quotation.  Design may be 
performed next year, if funds are available. 

 
Blacktail Drive 
 

This street south off of Airport Road will serve Sierra Chemicals and other 
developments.  The work is complete except for punch list items. 

 
Rebates for Water Appliances 
 

Rebates for low-flush toilets and reduced water use clothes washers will 
be offered to citizens who purchase and install these appliances.  Those 
who take advantage of this offer will receive a $100 rebate off the 
installation cost on up to 3 toilets and 1 clothes washer.  A total of $400 
in rebate is possible. 
 

Development Projects 
 
 Staff is working on the following development projects: 
 

Development projects on hold because of the present economic 
downturn: 
 Pioneer Mesa, Phase 2  14th Street Marketplace 

  Scalzo Ranch (The Grove)  West Side Mobile Homes 
 Comfort Suites   Whiteriver Plaza 
 Remington Square   The Farm 

  Eagles Nest    Roan View Industrial Park  
  Rimrock    Trapper Hollow 

    
Development projects presently under construction include: 

   
Creekside Townhomes (punch list items) 
NUTS sidewalk demolition  
Kum & Go at 26th Street 

The paving and retaining wall work should be completed 
during the second week of November. 

Sierra Chemicals  
Aaron’s Development 

 
Projects in progress through Planning/Engineering are: 
 

  Kum & Go at Centennial Parkway and Railroad Avenue 



 

S:\City Council Packet Deliverables\November 2, 2011\11B - STATUS REPORT-PW-110211.doc                                     Page 7 of 7 

  Kum & Go at 14th Street 
  Queen’s Crown 
  Rifle Airpark 
  Xcel Operations Center 
  Spring Crossing Farmers Market 
 

Right-of-Way Permits 
 

No new active permits for Contractors to use the public R/W have been 
issued.   

   
Garfield County Projects within the Rifle Area 

 
Garfield County Airport Runway Realignment and Improvements 
 

The City improvements in this project are now complete with only one punch 
list item (which the County says they will do with the next Airport project) and 
the as-builts remaining. 
 

Garfield County Airport Water and Sewer System Expansion 
  

A report has been delivered on deficiencies in the existing water/wastewater 
systems at the Airport and a meeting was held to discuss these concerns with 
the County Airport Manager, who will correct the deficiencies.  The majority of 
the items have been completed.    
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 


	00 - Agenda 111102
	02A - 111019mn Minutes
	02B - Creekbend Liquor License Renewal 
	02C - Ordinance 11 for packet
	02D - Ordinance 13-11-Refuse
	02E - Ordinance 14-11-Special Event Permit
	02F - Ordinance 15-11-VIP Advisory Board
	02G - Rifle Hts Subd Default 
	02H - Accounts Payable 11-2-11
	Council Letter-Legal-110211
	05 - Elks Lodge RFPD special event 
	06 - Elks Lodge City of Rifle special event 
	07 - Building Codes Memo
	07 - Ordinance 12-11-IBC 2009-Legal-110211
	09 - Ordinance 16-11-Liquor Code
	10 - Ruedi Contract Memo
	Administrative Reports
	11B - Police 3rd qtr report
	11B - STATUS REPORT-PW

